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WISHES ALL CANARITES 
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NOVEMBER 2024 

FROM THE DESK OF GENERAL SECRETARY 

 

 

A journey Par Excellence 
 

Dear Friends/Associate Members  
 
Our warmest Greetings to all of 
you on the joyous occasion of 
119th Founder's Day. 
 
While our beloved Bank's marking 
its 119th Founder's Day is 
laudable, our Founder the most 
venerated Ammembal Subbarao 
Pai's achievements stretch beyond 
the Bank and need recalling for 
the new generation.  
 

One hundred nineteen years ago, 
a man with rare courage ventured 
on the first steps to start a Bank in 
Mangaluru. Realising that smaller 
borrowers- small traders and 
peasants - were at the mercy of 
money lenders who were charging 
interest in excess of 50%. 
Moreover, he realised that 
traditional channels for savings 
were not entirely risk-free and that 
a longer institutional framework 
would not only protect and reward 
savings but also provide a 
profitable avenue for credit that 



 

The House Magazine of Canara Bank Retired Officers’ Association  ®                                      P a g e  | 3 

would challenge the stranglehold 
of the money lenders in the 
rural areas. 
 
In the early 1900s Arbuthnot 
Company, which collected 
deposits from the Public and gave 
loans, crashed and caused 
widespread distress in South 
Canara District. Many families lost 
all their savings in the crash. The 
smaller business people found it 
very difficult to get credit except at 
prohibitive rates of interest. Our 
Founder foresaw disaster ahead, if 
the community did not mobilise its 
own resources to help itself. The 
result was the starting on July 1st, 
1906 of the Canara Hindu 
Permanent Fund Ltd. which was 
later to become Canara Bank. The 
venture proved an instant 
success. That so soon after the 
crash of Arbuthnot, the people 
entrusted their savings to the 
newly started institution, is an 
eloquent testimony of the trust 
people had in our Founder. 
 
The venture established with 2000 
shares of Rs.50/- each was one of 
the first joint stock companies to 
be floated in South Canara 
District. It is pertinent to note here 
that our Founder toured the entire 
South Canara District in bullock 
cart to mobilise the capital fund for 
the venture. The Public supported 
the venture whole heartedly. 
During that particular time it was 

not just the money lenders who 
were its competitors. The area 
was already serviced by Bank of 
Madras which enjoyed a 
significant presence in southern 
coastal Karnataka at that time. 
Our Founder did not see the 
incumbent bank as a threat 
because he realised that Bank of 
Madras catered almost exclusively 
to the large merchants and 
landlords and was not accessible 
to those lower down the social and 
economic strata. This was apart 
from the fact that Bank of Madras 
charged high interest rates from 
borrowers. Our Founder set the 
following principles while starting 
the venture: " A good Bank is not 
only the financial heart of the 
community but also one with an 
obligation of helping in every 
possible manner to improve the 
economic conditions of the 
common people". These lofty 
thoughts symbolise a legacy of 
unwavering dedication and serve 
as a beacon for the present 
generation to uphold the values 
cherished by our Founder. 
 
The bank has gone through 
various phases of its growth 
trajectory over hundred years of its 
existence. A rash of Bank 
collapses in India in the 1920s and 
1930s, most notably that of the 
Travancore National Bank and 
Quilon Bank in 1938 resulted in a 
loss of confidence but Canara 
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Bank remained unscathed. It is 
evident that Canara Bank had 
emerged unscathed from the 
period of intense uncertainty in 
Indian banking, when smaller 
banks were struggling to remain 
on their feet in conditions that 
were aggravated first by the great 
Depression and then by the 
gathering war clouds.  
 
Growth of Canara Bank was 
phenomenal, especially after 
nationalization in the year 1969, 
attaining the status of a national 
level player in terms of 
geographical reach and clientele 
segments. The eventful journey of 
the Bank has been characterised 
by several memorable milestones. 
Today Canara Bank occupies a 
premier position in the comity of 
Indian Banks. More than a century 
later Canara Bank continues its 
journey as a premier Bank in 
India, one that pairs traditional 
prudential values so essential for a 
systematically important institution 
with the daring of embracing 
modernity.  
 
Our founder was a visionary far 
ahead of his times and life, he 
became a living soul and his 
philanthropic zeal continues to 
touch the lives of innumerable 
people even today. A lawyer and 
banker by profession, an 
educationist by temperament, he 
was the foremost among the pre-

independence luminaries who 
shaped the future of South Canara 
District and India. His concern for 
social upliftment, gave birth in 
1891 of the Canara High School at 
Mangaluru, the century old 
precursor to the conglomeration of 
Canara Educational Institutions, of 
today. He started Canara High 
School for girls in 1895 which was 
a revolutionary step at a time 
when educating the girls was a 
taboo.  The seeds sown by the 
Founder more than a Century ago 
have grown into huge banyan  tree 
providing shelter to the society in 
terms of education, employment 
opportunities and financial support 
to the welfare, prosperity and 
progress of the society.  
 
We are very happy to note that our 
MD & CEO has decided to 
commemorate the occasion by 
displaying in every branch, the 
journey of our Founder in a bullock 
cart to mobilise Capital Fund from 
the general public in South Canara 
District. This step being taken to 
create awareness among the 
present generation of employees 
of our bank about the humble 
beginnings and the struggle 
waged by our Founder to build this 
great institution. Our Founder Sri 
Subba Rao Pai has remained an 
enduring source of inspiration 
across generations. This is a great 
tribute to the visionary. 
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We wish all our members and their 
families a very healthy, happy life 
for all the days ahead. 
 

J S Jagadeesh.                                       
BENGALURU 
General Secretary.                               
 05.11.2024 

 
************************************************************************************* 

 

Helping hand never hesitates 

 

I use to call our president A N Krishnamurthy as Comrade but today I could feel the real 

meaning of Comrade. 

 

I am in a holiday family tour, starting from Bangalore, while staying at Bangalore we planned for 

a routine heart check-up of my wife at  Sri Jayadeva Institute of Science and Research, 

accordingly visited the hospital and after thorough check-up doctors suggested for immediate 

admission,  I was not at all prepared for the situation, I was not carrying insurance documents, 

then I called our president A N Krishnamurthy, who by then at Delhi being one of the 

participants of Dharna program, and apprised him the situation,  I was surprised to notice that 

within few minutes ANK sent me through WhatsApp my insurance documents (IBA MEDICLAIM) 

even without asking my staff number.  

 

He asked me to meet Mr Nagesh staff of our branch inside the Hospital premises, when I meet 

him, I found he was appraised and instructed by ANK, he took me to the insurance desk and 

completed the cashless formalities, He took me to the Doctor under whom my wife was 

admitted, and introduced me and requested for care, before angiography and subsequent 

angioplasty. 

 

I started feeling that I am not alone, rather everybody with me here in Bangalore. 

 

I was staying at Bangalore Holiday home at Indiranagar, but my booking was till 24th Oct, 

Comrade ANK arranged my stay closed to the Hospital, that to almost free of cost.  

 

I am overwhelmed, and deeply obliged for the help and apathy shown to me. 

Thank you Comrade ANK, and your team.  

 

Shyamal Kumar Sinha  

Kolkata 
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CIRCULAR NO. GIST OF THE CIRCULAR ISSUED DURING JUNE 2024 

113/2024 

01-10-2024 

 GMISR for the year 2024-25 –exorbitant pricing of the Top Up policy for the Bank Retirees. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_113-24.pdf  

114/2024 

02-10-2024 

 CBPRO displays a massive show of unity and solidarity at Kolkata on 30th September, 2024 

as a prelude to the centralized Dharna programme at Jantar Mantar, Delhi on 23rd October, 

2024. https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_114-24.pdf  

115/2024 

02-10-2024 

CBPRO organizes massive Dharna at Bengaluru & Kolkata 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_115-24.pdf  

116/2024 

05-10-2024 

CBPRO displays a massive show of unity and solidarity at Bhubaneswar on 4th October, 2024 

as a prelude to the centralized Dharna programme at Jantar Mantar, Delhi on 23rd October, 

2024.   https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_116-24.pdf  

117/2024 

06-10-2024 

Our affiliate at Dhanalakshmi Bank held their 11th Biennial Conference in the midst of 

enthusiasm and grandeur.  https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_117-24.pdf  

118/2024 

07-10-2024 

Huge gathering of the members of Canara Bank Retired Officers Association takes place at 

Bengaluru on 6th October, 2024.  https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_118-24.pdf  

119/2024 

08-10-2024 

CBPRO displays a massive show of unity and solidarity at Chennai on 7th October,2024as a 

prelude to the centralized Dharna programme at Jantar Mantar, Delhi on 23rd 

October,2024.  https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_119-24.pdf  

120/2024 

09-10-2024 

Group medical insurance scheme for Bank Retirees for the year November 2024 to October 

2025 -- a comparative evaluation and our advisory to members. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_120-24.pdf  

121/2024 

10-10-2024 

Your Organisation's Call to members stationed in and around Delhi and adjoining states for 

attending the Centralized Dharna Programme to be held at Jantar Mantar, Delhi on 23rd 

October, 2024 at the call of CBPRO.  https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_121-24.pdf  

122/2024  

19-10-2024 

CBPRO displays a massive show of unity and solidarity at Jaipur on 17th October, 2024 as a 

prelude to the Centralised Dharna programme at Jantar Mantar, Delhi on 23rd October, 

2024. https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_122-24.pdf  

123/2024  

19-10-2024 

CBPRO displays a massive show of solidarity and unity at Guwahati on 18th October 2024 as 

a prelude to the centralized Dharna at Delhi on 23rd October, 2024. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_123-24.pdf  

124/2024 

20-10-2024 

CBPRO displays a massive show of unity and solidarity at Hyderabad on 19th October, 2024 

as a prelude to the centralized Dharna at Delhi on 23rd October,2024. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_124-24.pdf  

 

 

AIBPARC NEWS 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_113-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_114-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_115-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_116-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_117-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_118-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_119-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_120-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_121-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_122-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_123-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_124-24.pdf
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125/2024 

20-10-2024 

Media reports on the imminent possibility of relief in respect of GST on Premium of Health 

Insurance of Senior Citizens.  https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_125-24.pdf  

126/2024 

20-10-2024 

Largely attended Dharna programme organised by CBPRO/AIBPARC at Patna as a prelude to 

the centralized Dharna programme at Delhi on 23rd October ,2024. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_126-24.pdf 

127/2024 

21-10-2024 

Largely attended Dharna programme organised by CBPRO/ AIBPARC, Uttar Pradesh State 

Committee on 21st October 2024 as a prelude to the centralized Dharna programme at 

Jantar Mantar, Delhi on 23rd October, 2024. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_127-24.pdf  

128/2024 

21-10-2024 

CBPRO/AIBPARC, Kerala State Unit, organized a massively attended Dharna programme at 

Ernakulam today as a prelude to the centralized Dharna programme to be held at Delhi on 

23rd October, 2024 at the call of CBPRO.  https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_128-24.pdf  

129/2024 

27-10-2024 

Historical Dharna organized by CBPRO at Jantar Mantar, Delhi, on 23rd October,2024 

demanding immediate resolution of all the Pending issues affecting the interest of Bank 

Pensioners and Retirees.   https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_129-24.pdf  

130/2024 

27-10-2024 

Historic Dharna at Jantar Mantar, Delhi, on 23rd October,2024 at the call of CBPRO -- 

AIBPARC as a constituent of CBPRO conveys thanks and gratitude to all its leaders, activists, 

veterans and members for their energetic participation to make the event a memorable 

one.    https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_98-24.pdf  

   

     

    

   

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_125-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_126-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_127-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_128-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_129-24.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_98-24.pdf
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REGIONAL  

ROUNDUP 

ALL PHOTOS ARE POSTED IN THE “PHOTOS GALLERY” 

 

AGRA 

A General Body Meeting of Agra Region 

held on 16.10.2024 at Lead Bank Office, 

Agra.  The meeting was presided over 

by Sri S K Sharma, ex AGM, a very 

active in social and cultural activities. 

Commencing the meeting, Mr Pankaj 

Kumar Saxena welcomed the members. 

Rich tributes were paid to our beloved 

colleagues who left us in the past and 

conveyed our heartfelt condolences to 

the bereaved family members. also 

mourned the loss of hundreds of lives in 

Wynad and other affected areas. He 

also given a brief on Pension updation, 

the latest updates about MC Singla 

case, the stay order granted by 

Allahabad High Court for stopping the 

recovery of commuted amount after 

10years. All the members appreciated 

the sincere efforts taken by our JGS Sri 

Vidhu Mohan, Sri S N Sharma, Sri P K 

Agarwal and the entire dedicated team 

of CBROA. He also informed about 

Various court cases for 

Restoration of Commutation Recovery 

immediately after 10 years and stay 

orders issued by Courts against 

recovery and AIBPARC and CBROAs 

stand in the matter of going to the court 

on behalf of all the members.  The 

discussion also took place on the Issues 

like Stagnation increments, Review of 

Ex gratia payments. He further 

emphasized the need for enrolment of 

non-members especially from E-

Syndicate Bank. Members also objected 

and requested to refrain from posting 

political and irrelevant messages in the 

*Retirees welfare Group. Mr Kanchan 

Singh sought for certain clarifications 

regarding welfare measures for retirees. 

Mr Shyam Sunder Gupta spoken about 

family pension and other benefits to 

them. Mr Sanjay Goyal reiterated that 

members should participate in cultural 

activities. Mr R B Dubey informed the 

present scenario and suggested certain 

precautions to be taken by retirees. He 

also discussed the benefits of Go Digit 

Super Top up Policy. Mr Ankit Sahgal, 

OGS , CLO Agra Circle, CBOA assured 

all support from CBOA. Mr O S Rawat 

expressed thanks to all the members.    

 

AHMEDABAD 

Meeting of CBROA members of 

Ahmedabad City was held on 

21/10/2024 at Learning Centre, 

Ahmedabad exclusively to discuss 

Insurance matter, both IBA Medical 

Insurance Policy Renewal and Go Digit 

Insurance 's Super Top Up policy. Two 

Representatives of K M Dastur, Mr. 
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Ramesh Diwankar and Mr Ganesh 

Vania were present and explained in 

detail Super Top Up policy offered by 

Go Digit Insurance Co.at competitive 

prices.  We had very good Interaction 

with them. Members present filled up the 

form and handed over cheques of 

premiums payable. Thereafter, Mr.N P 

Vankar proposed Vote of Thanks. 

Meeting concluded with light snacks and 

Tea/Coffee. 

 

BAREILY 

On 25.10.24, a general body meeting of 

CBROA MEMBERS of Bareilly unit was 

held at Rajendra Nagar, Bareilly branch. 

The following points were discussed: 1. 

Pension Updation - Latest position of 

Court cases filed in different courts.  2. 

Restoration of Commuted Pension after 

10 years. 3. Staff Welfare Schemes of 

the Bank. The members hailed the 

initiative taken by the bank to give  ₹ 
10000/- on the death of a Retiree.  Mr. 

V. C. Gupta Rao said his medical bill 

issue which is lying pending without 

being taken notice of.  12 members 

were present in the meeting.  Mr. B. K. 

Kochhar presided over the meeting. The 

meeting concluded with Vote of thanks 

proposed by the District Secretary. 

 

BENGALURU 

On 17.10.24 CBROA Chairman Mr G A 

Hande felicitated Mr M G Narasimha 

Nayak (12167 LM 5322)  at his 

residence on his attaining the age of 75 

recently.  Mr Nayak was very happy to 

receive the honour & promised donation. 

 

GHAZIABAD 

The general body meeting of CBROA 

members of Ghaziabad – NCR region 

held on 22/10/2024 at Ghaziabad.  The 

meeting commenced at 12:00 noon with 

the lighting of the holy lamp by 

dignitaries. The meeting was graced by - 

Mr. Jagadeesh J S, General Secretary, 

Mr. A. N. Krishnamurthy, President, Mr. 

G. A. Hande, Chairman, Mr. Vidhu 

Mohan, CBROA Joint General 

Secretary, Mr. Arun Sharma, CBOA 

Vice President.  Mr. Vidhu Mohan 

welcomed distinguished guests and all 

other participants including Mr. Satish 

Ghai, DGS, G. M. Khurana, DGS, Mr. 

Mukesh Kamal Kapoor, CC Member, 

and other leaders. 

Mr. Jagadeesh J S delivered a 

comprehensive speech covering: 1. 

Pension updation, 2. Inclusion of Special 

Allowance for terminal benefits, 3. IBA's 

mediclaim policy (now more retiree-

friendly with 47% reduced premium), 4. 

Welfare schemes management, 5. 

Request for donations to the welfare 

fund 

6. Restoration of Commuted Portion of 

Pension (expressing scepticism), 7. 

Appreciation for MD & CEO's empathy 

and support, 8. Gratitude to Mr. Ravi K., 

CBOA General Secretary, for his 

support Mr. A. N. Krishnamurthy, our 

President updated on Pension Updation 

cases and assured AIBPARC's future 

discussions with IBA.   Mr. G. A. Hande 

reported on expenses and austerity 

measures.  Mr. Arun Sharma, CBOA 

Vice President, discussed current 
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banking issues and assured full support 

from CBOA. 

 

Felicitations: 2 new members Mr Pratap 

Singh and Mr Swami Sharan Nath were 

welcomed with shawls and gifts.  Two 

senior members Mr Jai Prakash Gupta 

and Mr Jagdeesh Prasad were 

honoured for reaching 75 years of age 

with shawls, citations, mementos, and 

sweets. Vote of Thanks proposed by Mr. 

V. P. Singh.  65+ members from 

Ghaziabad, Meerut, Delhi, and other 

NCR cities. 

 

KERALA 

KERALA - ERNAKULAM 

We had on Saturday, 05.10.2024 visited 

the residence of our Life Members who 

had attained the age of 75 years (upto 

30.06.2024) and not being honoured by 

our Association for the same so far.  We 

had visited the residences of Sri. V B 

Shenoy, Sri. Ravindran B Nayar, Sri. 

Raghunath Prabhakar and Sri. M S 

Ranganathan.  We were well received 

by our Seniors at their residence and 

they had shared their experiences 

during the good old days while working 

in the Bank. The members were 

Venerated by wearing shawl and 

handed over the Citation from our 

Association to them. The team members 

who visited our Senior Members include 

Smt. Lalithammal, Sri. G B Sharma, Sri. 

Babu Jose and the undersigned. Thanks 

to our Senior Members for their kind co-

operation and the team mates for all the 

support. 

 

KERALA - KOTTAYAM 

We have much pleasure to report that 

an Online Meeting of the Members of 

CBROA, Kottayam District was held on 

08/10/'24 evening as scheduled.    Mr. 

M. C. Jacob, President presided over 

the Meeting.  Mr. Paul Mathew, Dist 

Secretary welcomed the gathering.  Mr. 

P. U. Ipe inaugurated the Session.   Mr. 

PPJ Nair, Joint General Secretary of 

CBROA in his Keynote Address 

extensively covered on the various 

issues related to the Health Insurance 

Scheme due for renewal by this month 

end. Many related issues are beyond 

the control of our leaders. However, he 

thanked our organisational leaders and 

the MD & CEO of Canara Bank. He 

opined that Premium of the Base Policy 

of Rs.4 lakhs is reasonable as 

compared to that of last year. However, 

the Premium on Top up Policy is 

exorbitantly high. He also referred to the 

proposal of Go Digit Insurance 

Company offering Top up Policy 

(covering above Rs. 3 lakhs) at a 

reasonable Premium. He advised the 

participants to wait for another week for 

possible further clarifications and then 

only to submit Option.      Mr. V. D. 

Chacko also extensively covered on the 

various implications of the proposed 

renewal Scheme. It is a fact that many 

of the factors involved are beyond our 

control. We should take maximum 

advantage out of the proposed 

Insurance Scheme. One and all should 

opt for the Base Policy of Rs.4 lakhs. 

Affordable amount of Top up Policy is 

also to be considered. At the same time, 
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those who are above 70 should opt for 

the Ayushman Bharat Insurance 

Scheme also. M/s P. U.Ipe, Joseph 

Mathew,  P.M. Shahjahan  and few 

others  aired the various difficulties 

being experienced. Mr. M. 

Krishnakumar, our RS from Ernakulam 

had also attended; however, he had to 

leave a bit early due to certain other 

preoccupations. Mr. P. M. Shajahan 

offered Vote of Thanks to M/s. PPJ Nair, 

JGS, M. Krishnakumar, RS, P. U. Ipe, 

V.D. Chacko and all of the other 

participants.    18 Members took pains to 

attend the programme.  We thank one 

and all of the participants in this regard.  

  

KERALA – KANNUR 

Our Kannur Team Kerala Honouring 

Sri.A Surendraraj retired senior Manger 

Kannur on his becoming 75 years 

young. Sri P V Surendran our R S,Sri P 

P Sudhakaran Secretary Sri C P 

Rajendran and Sri Manoj Executive 

members attended this ceremony on 

22nd of October.  

 

KERALA – KOZHIKODE 

Kozhikode District unit of CBROA Kerala 

conducted meeting for its district 

members on 27/09/2024. The 

proceedings of the meeting are given 

below briefly:  The Meeting commenced 

at 3.00pm. Sri Anil Kumar V, District 

Secretary welcomed the participants 

and requested the members for 

acceptance of the minutes of last 

meeting. He briefly mentioned the 

developments since the last meeting 

specifically the achievement in Health 

Insurance Scheme, the collection for the 

welfare fund of CBROA, the relief fund 

collection for Waynad. On Bank 

Nationalization day, July 19th, a Dharna 

was conducted by AIBPRAC. Sri. 

M.K.Raghavan, Member  Of Parliament,  

inaugurated the program. From our side 

there was good participation.  Sri.V.Anil 

Kumar also mentioned about the call of 

CBROA Central Committee for enrolling 

all Retd Officers who are non-members 

as well as family pensioners and 

requested members to actively 

participate in the same.  

Further CBROA State committee 

conducted an online meeting for setting 

up a State Cultural Wing and Sri K P P 

Nair, Sri K. V. Raghavan, Sri. E. 

Prabhakaran and P Ramakrishnan 

attended the meeting. There was a good 

response from our members and 

Sri.E.Prabhakaran was elected as the 

District Co-ordinator for Kozhikode. He 

requested all our members to actively 

participate in all cultural programs. SHRI 

K V RAGHAVAN, CC Member, in his 

address while explaining the various 

organisational matters explained in brief 

the available details of the New 

Insurance policy. Limit is 4lakhs for 

officers. As and when details are 

received he assured the members to 

immediately post the same in group. 

Further as per existing policy, he 

explained that although many issues 

were there regarding TPA, limit for 

various treatment etc, many of the 

complaints were resolved in the Circle 

level quarterly meeting with TPA at 

Trivandrum. Because of that complaints 
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have come down. Now in Calicut also 

same procedure has to be adopted, 

after the New Policy becomes effective. 

Sri.P.Ramakrishnan Regional Secretary 

in his address mentioned that our parent 

organisation AIBPARC has decided to 

conduct a Dharna at New Delhi covering 

the issues of bank retirees.  

Sri.K.P.P.Nair informed that one of our 

member Sri.Madhusoodhan has  offered 

to donate 7 cents of land  for 

rehabilitation of the  wynad landslide 

victims. He invited Sri.Madhusoodhan to 

speak a few words in this regard. Sri. 

Madhusoodhan confirmed that he has 

offered the land which will be given 

directly to the beneficiary after due 

selection process. One widow who is 

paralyzed has already been identified 

and final process is being done. All the 

members appreciated the kind gesture 

and gave a standing ovation to him. 

Thereafter a cultural programme was 

conducted in which all our members 

participated. Sri Suresh.C, 

Veyayudhan.P.T, Prabhakaran.E., 

Prameela, Jayachandran entertained 

the group with beautiful songs.  

The meeting concluded by 5.30 pm with 

the vote of thanks by Sri 

.N.P.Radhakrishnan. He specifically 

mentioned the good discussion covering 

all issues and stressed the need for  

more participation in future meetings. 

 

KOLKATA 

CBROA Kolkata Unit organised a 

Condolence meeting on 18th October 

2024 at Krishna Pada Memorial Hall, 

Surya Sen hi Street Kolkata in memory 

of Comrade Ramendra Nath Mondal, 

Central Committee member of CBROA 

and a consistent trade unionist leader of 

Bank Officer's Movements. Mr. Mondal 

breathed his last on 23rd September 

2024. The meeting held in evening 

during 4 to 7 PM in the presence of 46 

persons including representative of 

CBOA and Tagore Research Institute 

with whom he was associated for long 

time. The meeting was presided over by 

the Sri Bhuban Pramanik, Regional 

Chairman of CBROA, Kolkata. After 

one-minute silence in memory of the 

departed soul, the portrait of our beloved 

Ramen da was garlanded by Sri Asit 

Ranjan Rakshit, Vice President, 

CBROA, Sri Bhuban Pramanik, 

Regional Chairman CBROA Kolkata and 

Mrs. Arati Mondal, wife of Ramenda and 

paid homage with flowers by all the 

members present in the meeting. Other 

than the President of the meeting 

Sixteen members including the Vice 

President of CBROA Sri Asit Rakshit, 

Central Committee Members of CBROA 

Sri Shyamal Sinha, Regional Secretary 

Sri Prabir Chakraborty, Mr. Ujjwal 

Narayan Saha, Organising Secretary 

and CNT member of CBOA, Mr. 

Ayanendra Nath Basu, Secretary of 

Tegore Research Institute shared their 

memories with Ramenda during their 

course of work. Mrs. Arati Mondal, wife 

of Ramenda was shared her memorable 

moments in the family life.  One thing is 

common in all the speeches that the 

quality of leadership and commitment  

towards society and the helping 

attitudes for the members as well as 
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people in general,  be it for  natural 

calamities or pandemic . Comrade 

Ramen da possessed and the skill of his 

defence for his fellow colleagues was 

unparalleled throughout his career in 

Canara Bank. Everybody remembered 

his smiling face and attractive pleasing 

witty personality. All expressed their 

heartfelt condolences to the family 

members friends and relatives of 

Ramenda. Vote of thanks was given by 

Sri Jyoti Shankar Roychowdhury. 

 

MUMBAI 

Friends, yesterday ie on 26th October 

2024, we felicitated, our member, Mr 

Shabbir S Biviji( at his residence  at 

Goregaon) on his attaining 75 years of 

age on 13th October 2024. He is born 

on 14th October 1949. He joined the 

Bank on 18th November 1972, & retired 

under SVRS on 31st March 2001 after 

serving in various branches of our Bank. 

On the occasion, Mr Shabbir donated 

Rs 10000/- to CBROA, for which we are 

immensely thankful to him. Seen in the 

photos are Mr & Mrs Shabbir, his Son, 

Daughter in law, his grandchildren & his 

Cousin, Smt Nilofer Biviji, who is also 

our ex staff. Also seen in the photos are 

our activists, Mr Sant, Mr Sinkar & Mrs 

Snehalata Kanchan.  We wish Mrs & Mr 

Shabbir long, healthy & happy life 

together.  

 

MYSURU 

On 17th October, CBROA Mysuru 

Region honoured Smt. Geetha Selvaraj 

Staff no 7548 on attaining 75 years. Sri 

Dharmaraja, RS, Sri. Shivaprasad, 

DGS, Sri. Atmaram, AGS and activist Sri 

Ramu were present. On the same day, 

they honoured Sri. N. Durgesh Nayak on 

attaining 90 years at his residence. Both 

the members rejoiced the felicitation 

done by CBROA. 

 

ODISHA 

As per the call given by CBPRO a 

massive Dharna was organised on 04-

10-2024 at Lower PMG Bhubaneswar 

from 10 am onwards. It is a preclude 

before the National Level Mass Dharna 

on 23rd October at Jantar Mantar New 

Delhi. 

The main Demands are - 1. Updation of 

Pension. 2. Computation of special 

allowance for gratuity and pension. 3. 

Health insurance at affordable cost. 4. 

Restoration of Commuted value of 

pension after 10 years. 5. Improvement 

in commutation factor in SBI at par with 

industry level. 6. 50% pension to SBI 

retirees from date of retirement. 

Speaking on the occasion the joint 

convener of CBPRO Odisha, Com U K 

Dash of SBIPA and Com Niranjan 

Jogania of AIBPARC exclusively 

elaborated on all burning issues 

pertaining to Bank Retirees. Also 

spoken on the occasion President 

AIBPARC Com A K Motayed briefly 

talked about the fighting spirit of 

Retirees to clinch the pension updation 

against all odds. Also spoken on the 

occasion Com Ganesh Mishra, Com P K 

Panda of OGB and leaders of other 

affiliates. Com GS AIBPARC also given 

me an opportunity to speak on the 

occasion. It was a strong participation of 
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400 plus Bank Retirees from SBIPA and 

AIBPARC from Bhubaneswar and 

nearby. CBROA Odisha unit made its 

strong participation with 46 members.  

All the Senior members raised 

electrifying slogans with raising hands 

as mark of unity and solidarity reflected 

their dissatisfaction over the negative 

attitude of IBA on Pension Updation 

issue. There was media coverage by 

Nandighosh TV and others for publicity. 

Com Niranjan Jogania and Com U K 

Dash elaborated the demands of Bank 

Retirees to the Media on a Clear tone. 

Vote of thanks given by Com President 

to all for active participation. 

CBROA Zindabad, AIBPARC Zindabad, 

CBPRO Zindabad. 

 

PATNA 

Dharna NEAR INDIAN BANK RO, 

PATNA BY AIBPARC, BIHAR STATE. 

 On 20.10.2024 All India Bank 

Pensioners under the banner of CBPRO 

assembled in almost more than 100 in 

numbers & demonstrated publicly in 

support of Retirees Issues. 

Subsequently, AIBPARC convened a 

meeting at its State Headquarters to 

chalk out the programme with regard to 

the Demonstration to be held at Jantar 

Mantar, New Delhi and also Governing 

Council Meeting to be held  

"Today, a massive dharna programme 

was held before Indian Bank Main 

Branch, Patna from 3 pm to 6 pm 

pressing hard the Government and IBA 

for early settlement of long standing 

legitimate demands of 

retirees/pensioners. It was presided by 

Sri Pawan Kumar Vice President, 

AIBPARC, Bihar. It was well attended by 

nearly 100 members from different 

corners of the state. All affiliates 

attended the programme. The mass was 

addressed by senior leaders, including 

Sarvshree Pawan Kumar, Arun Akhouri, 

Umesh Tiwari, S M Ahmed, S K Singh, 

R K Mishra, H K Verma and Mr. Kundan 

Gupta. Vote of thanks was given by Mr. 

Amrendra Kumar. 

 

Proceedings of the General body 

meeting of CBROA (Patna unit) held at 

CBOA OFFICE Patna on 20th October 

2024. About 39 members participated in 

the meeting. 

The meeting was presided over by Sri. 

Ram Krishna, Ex DGM. The meeting 

started with giving tribute to members 

who left us between the last meeting 

and the present one (1.Rajendra Kr.Jha 

2. Partha Mondal, 3. Kanhaia Srivastava 

4. Raj Kumar Mahto left us during the 

period.)    In his presidential speech, Mr 

Ram Krishna spoke about the need of 

the hour, to make more LM and AM of 

CBROA, current scenario of updation of 

pension and IBA health insurance.  

Regional Secretary Sri Prabhanshu 

Kumar welcomed all the members 

present in the meeting. He introduced 

new members to the house (G K Sinha 

and P Priyadarshi). Sri R.N.Thakur 

Central Committee member initiated the 

deliberations. He briefed on the  

following organisational matters: 1. State 

committee proceedings conducted on 

June 24. 2. He praised the initiative 

taken by our General Secretery and his 
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team for the upliftment of retiree. Such 

as IBA HEALTH INSURANCE, by 

combining employee and retiree policies 

to reduce premiums of base policy. 3. 

He also praised for the negotiation with 

KMD for lower rate of supper top up for 

retiree.  4. He also commended our GS 

for negotiation with MD for more amount 

of payment to opted IBA insurance and 

payment to retiree directly to their 

pension account. 5. He congratulated 

our MD for making an announcement to 

give Rs.10000.00 for a funeral in case of 

demises of retirees also.  6. He 

appealed to members to make life 

members and associate members who 

are not our members as retirements are 

less from our region5 associate 

membership form collected during the 

meeting.  7. Sri Gageshwar Pradad ex-

AGM Dr. D. N. Jha ex-Manager 

Rajendra Rajak ex officer has been 

facilitated by garlanding, Angabastram 

and citation issued by central office.  All 

the members (39 in no) actively 

participated in the meeting, and their 

queries were sorted out by our Regional 

Secretary Sri Prabhanshu Kumar. The 

meeting ended with a vote of thanks 

given by Sri Sanjay Kumar  for 

participating in the meeting. 

 

PUDUCHERY 

CBROA Unit of Puduchery Region 

conducted a meeting for its members on 

20-10-2024 at Puduchery. The meeting 

is presided over by Com. S. Baskaran, 

Retired DGM.  After paying tributes to 

the fellow Comrades who departed us in 

the intervening period from our last 

meeting, we discussed current affairs.  

The CC meeting decisions are 

elaborated, suspension of death relief, 

enhancement in medical aid to 30000/- 

etc. The Unit appreciated CBROA 

leadership who initiated the merger of 

health insurance policies of both serving 

and retired employees and also Canada 

bank management ,our ED.for the 

efforts/taken/contributions made and 

considerable reduction in IBA premium 

and tie up arrangement with GO-DIGIT 

for super top up. Members expressed 

their concerns towards, Raksha TPA 

settlements, SWE disparity, etc.  

Members passed 3 resolutions and 

copies of which are sent to our Central 

Office.  Lastly, We felicitated Com. G. 

Thirunarayanan,who completed 75 

years of age. The Citation certificate is 

handed over by Com.S.Baskar. A 

memento, literal poetic greeting written 

by Com. Somasekar, is presented. Also 

honoured with shawl and garlands and 

members felicitated/ greeted him. 

 

PUNE 

The CBROA Pune General Body 

Meeting was held on October 21, 2024, 

at 9:30 AM, under the guidance of 

General Secretary Mr. J S Jagadeesh 

and Vice President Mr. R M Joshi from 

the Mumbai unit. A total of 115 members 

attended the meeting, was eager to hear 

from the speakers our General 

Secretary. 

The meeting started with Ganesh 

Vandana , lightning the lamps and 

garlanding our Founder Sri A Subbarao 

Pai.  Mr. R R Bagale, DGS, in Welcome 
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address provided updates on the 

developments within the Pune unit, 

while Mr. Deepak Dalvi, RS, shared 

membership details and initiatives aimed 

at uniting and engaging members 

through various programs. 

 

Mr. J S Jagadeesh addressed key 

issues affecting pensioners, including 

pension updation, commutation, DA 

neutralization, IBA group insurance 

policies, and the Go Digit Super TOP 

UP medical cover available through K M 

Dastur & Co. He emphasized the 

importance of affordable insurance for 

retirees and highlighted the need for a 

healthy, fulfilling life surrounded by loved 

ones.  He praised the Pune unit for their 

various activities done during last one 

year such as helping hand to Vanwasi  

Kalyan Ashram children, Warkari Seva 

& arranging Family get together with 

Jalsa and Bela ke Phool program. Our 

Pearl group has arranged various 

activities for women members. 

 

Lastly, our traditional MUQTCHHAND 

Diwali Ank, a regional publication 

promoting, motivating their hidden talent 

through their various articles poems and 

other arts was released. Many members 

participate wholeheartedly and make it a 

beautiful and nice magazine. 

 

Mr. Jagadeesh also delved into the 

intricacies of pension updation, 

referencing past bipartite settlements 

and the qualifications needed for special 

allowances to ensure a reasonable 

pension for a happy retirement. Mr. R M 

Joshi also spoke about initiatives from 

the Mumbai unit, particularly the efforts 

of their ladies' group led by Ms. Pratibha 

Jayram. 

 

Pune unit converted one non-member of 

e syndicate Mr Mahindra Pagare, Ex-

Vice President of Syndicate Bank 

Retired Association. 

On this occasion we also felicitated our 

senior member Mr Avinash Phansalkar 

(8110) who completed platinum jubilee, 

he has donated Rs 5000/- to our welfare 

fund.  

The meeting concluded with   Pasaydan 

shloka by our lady members and Mr. 

Suneel Mehendale delivering the vote of 

thanks, he appealed the members to 

continue their support for the Pune unit. 

CBROA PUNE TEAM 

 

SHIVAMOGGA 

CBROA Shimoga Region conducted 

meeting of members on 18.10.2024 in 

Shimoga. Regional Secretary Sarja 

Jagadeesh welcomed the gathering and 

briefed the members about IBA Health 

Insurance Scheme and also Go Digit 

Super Top Up Scheme. Sri. K R 

Lingappa, Senior member requested the 

members to opt for Health Insurance 

and also told about the benefits of Go 

Digit Super Top Up policy. Members got 

clarified their doubts about both the 

schemes. Regional Secretary informed 

the members the stand of CBROA about 

restoration of commutation on 

completion of 10 years of retirement. Sri 

S G Ramesh proposed vote of thanks. 
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UDUPI 

Special CAMP was held on 21st Oct '24 

for collecting IBA Medical Insurance 

renewal forms and also helping 

members to apply online for both IBA 

medical insurance and Go Digit Super 

top policies.  53 members were present. 

Besides this our volunteers visited 

members’ residences who are unable to 
move out due to age related problems 

and assisted them to apply for renewal.  

During the camp senior members Sri U 

J Kamath and Sri Mohan Kini guided the 

members. Technical assistance was 

given by Sri K R Ganesh, Sri H R 

Nayak, Sri Vishwanath Kamath and Smt 

Shakuntala Pai. Volunteers Sri B M 

Shetty, Sri R V Shanbhogue, Sri K U 

Krishna helped for the smooth conduct 

of the camp.  We thank all these 

members for their service.  45 IBA 

insurance renewal forms were collected 

and submitted to HRM section CO 

Manipal apart from online submission. 

Also 15 members subscribed to Go Digit 

super top-up policy.  Sri Yogesh Bhat, 

AGS and K M Nayak, CC member were 

present. 

 

UTTARA KANNADA 

CBROA Team Uttara Kannada district 

felicitated Shri.Madhav S Hegde  , staff  

no 14619 and member ship no 2801 on 

28th October 2024 at his residence Sirsi 

, on his attaining 75 years of age. 

CBROA Team Uttara Kannada district, 

Wish him good health and happiness in 

the coming years.  Many members of 

Sirsi, were present on this occasion. We 

thank Sri. Mangesh U Kulkarni, DGS, 

who has come from Mangalore to attend 

the event.  

CBROA Team Uttara Kannada district 

also felicitated Shri. Suresh Marthappa 

Nayak, Staff No 1656 and membership 

no 505 on the same day at his residence 

Sirsi, on his attaining 75 years of age. 

CBROA Team Uttara Kannada district, 

Wish him good health and happiness in 

the coming years.  Our members Sri. 

Dayanand B Bhovi, Shri. Prabhakar 

Shirali, Sri. S H Gaitonde, Sri. 

Raveendra Revankar, Sri. Ananth G 

Hegde, Sri. Ganapati Soori, Sri. G S 

Murdeshwar and Shri. Bhujang Vaidya, 

were present on this occasion.   
 

 

 

 

TO VIEW ALL PHOTOS PLEASE VISIT PHOTO GALLERY 
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*MUQTCHHAND - 2024 Publication Ceremony* 
*CBROA Pune, October 21, 2024: * 

 

The CBROA Pune unit, under the leadership of Sri R R Bagale, Sri Deepak Dalvi, and 

Sri Sunil Mehendale, celebrated the publication of the 5th edition of the prestigious 

Diwali Ank, MUQTCHHAND - 2024, at the Swami Kripa Hall, Karve Nagar, Pune. The 

event marked a significant milestone for the organization and the literary community 

alike. The ceremony commenced with a vibrant performance by the PEARL group, 

featuring a beautiful Saraswati Vandana presented by Ms Anjali Joshi and Ms Seema 

Yeolekar. Anchor Sri Ajay Mutatkar started the function in his poetic style mentioning 

the Birth of Muqtchand Diwali Ank and its successful journey. 

 
The much anticipated unveiling of “MUQTCHHAND – 2024” was conducted by Sri  

Rajan Lakhe, President of Maharashtra Saahitya Parishad, Pimpri – Chinchwad, along 

with our General Secretary, Sri J S Jagdeesh.  In his editorial speech, Sri Suresh Sheth 

provided an insightful overview of MUQTCHHAND's journey, sharing his own poems 

and expressing gratitude to the editorial team and CBROA members for their valuable 

literary contributions.  

 

Sri Rajan Lakhe's guest address captivated the audience, earning generous applause 

from the literati present. He commended the remarkable efforts of CBROA Pune and 

the editorial team's commitment, highlighting the exceptional quality of articles, blogs, 
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and poems by Canara Bank family members, mentioning several standout pieces from 

this year's Diwali Ank. 

 
A special highlight of the program was the felicitation of Baby Arya Vikram Deshpande, 

a talented 12-year-old, contributor of a poem, and Ms Saraswati Raman, who received 

the prestigious Maharashtra Ratna Award for her contributions to spiritual enlightenment 

through yogic wisdom. Both were applauded for their achievements. The ceremony also 

recognized the unwavering support of Sri Bhalchandra Kulkarni from Ekveera 

Publication Co., who has collaborated with the organization for the past five years. 

Amidst the literary and cultural richness of the day, attendees enjoyed a delightful 

Shrikhand-Puri feast, providing an opportunity to connect with friends and colleagues. 

The concept of an आत्म निर्भर Diwali Ank, rooted in the contributions of its members, 

continues to thrive, embodying sincerity, commitment, and the hard work of those 

dedicated to its success. Sri Anil Deshpande, the ideator of the Diwali Ank during the 

COVID-19 pandemic, would undoubtedly be proud to witness this flourishing tradition 

year after year. 

A heartfelt thanks goes out to all our generous members, Ank Samiti, advertisers, and 

well-wishers for their continued support and contributions. 

The event was expertly anchored by Sri Ajay Mutatkar. The function concluded with 

Pasaydan by Ms Deepa Godbole and SrI Suneel Mehendale given vote of thanks to all 

who have made this event successful and CBROA Pune team ensured the program 

was a resounding success. 

 

*CBROA Pune (Team MUQTCHHAND)* 
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                                                               POEM By: Arun Sunder Raj 

 

      

FIGHT FRUSTRATION 

 

Sometimes life will be disgusting and difficult. 

Obstacles or setbacks, physical aches and pains, 

Happenings unforeseen, expectations unmet, 

Create psychological stress and frustrate us. 

 

Frustrated ones try to unload their frustrations, 

In all frustrating ways which further frustrates them. 

Frustratingly they are proud not to accept it, 

That frustrates others who can only pity them. 

 

In the life's game we cannot keep winning always, 

Must learn to accept gallantly, also defeats. 

Fight weakness and seek help from others when hapless, 

When we seek we will get, when we search will find it. 

 

Find solutions to whatever are the problems, 

By breaking them down into manageable steps.  

No problem of ours is without a solution, 

Only to diagnose it, we must have patience. 

 

Keep not aloof away from friends and family. 

Turn to meditation or music favourite. 

Engage in any creative activity, 

Develop some good hobbies, it is never late. 

 

The road of life will be rugged and bumpy oft, 

Complete the journey but never try to cut short. 

-------------------------------------------------- 

 

MEMBERS PAGE 

ARUN SUNDER RAJ 

MEM NO: 4857 



 

The House Magazine of Canara Bank Retired Officers’ Association  ®                                      P a g e  | 21 

SET TO CROSS 

MILE STONE 

 

Attaining 75 years of age is a 

milestone in the life of a retiree. 

Though statistically, longevity of life 

has increased, we are coming across 

several instances where many souls 

depart from us even before reaching 

the above milestone. Under such 

circumstances, it is really a cause for 

greeting the retirees who are set to 

reach the milestone and enthuse 

them to tread along. With this 

objective and in response to desires 

of several members that CBROA 

News features a list of members who 

are crossing 75 years of age during 

NOVEMBER 2024. 

MEM NO NAME STF NO PLACE DOB MOBILE

252 MANOHARAN   V 1899 COIMBATORE 13-11-1934 9444579132

MEM NO NAME STF NO PLACE DOB MOBILE

4745 R K MALIK 11069 PANIPAT 01-11-1949 9215660240

10712 KARTHIK RAMAJI KHAPARDE 16883 NAGPUR 01-11-1949 7588654704

3312 DAMODAR KAMATH H 8849 MANGALURU 02-11-1949 9481763733

4158 ANAND GAJANAN GOVEKAR 12195 BARDEZ - GOA 02-11-1949 9921715030

9921 Ms S SAROJA 11345 CHENNAI 02-11-1949 9444002610

3646 S B R BABUJI 11608 HYDERABAD 04-11-1949 9948404179

2920 RAMACHANDRA MURTHY  N V 17367 BENGALURU 05-11-1949 9886727790

3512 JOGINDER SINGH 43127 PANJALSHA PO 05-11-1949 9729794098

4555 I  NARASIMHA MURTHY 8720 KAKINADA 07-11-1949 9959352900

3073 PAIS  ROGER 15875 BENGALURU 08-11-1949 9945477262

4903 P V SUNDARESH 12163 MYSURU 08-11-1949 9449254810

8744 K BALADHANDAPANI 8824 COIMBATORE 10-11-1949 9047611332

810 SRINIVASAN  S R 13972 MYSURU 11-11-1949 9945649360

1653 KRISHNA MURTHI   K 13271 TIRUNELVELI 11-11-1949 9442958501

7432 CHANDRAKANT MARUTI BAL 10876 PUNE 11-11-1949 9881950742

3687 C RENGANATHAN 11368 CHENNAI 12-11-1949 9600164021

3427 GOPALAKRISHNA LAXMINARAYAN SHANBHAG 8873 MUMBAI 13-11-1949 9930603560

9672 ASHOK MORESHWAR KELKAR 10168 MUMBAI 13-11-1949 9820240877

8218 GIRDHAR GOPAL SHARMA 53188 GURUGRAM 14-11-1949 9868565063

943 VENKATASUBRAMANIAM  A 11557 CHENNAI 15-11-1949 9710743497

NANOGENARIANS

SEPTUAGENARIANS
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SET TO CROSS 

MILE STONE 

 
Attaining 75 years of age is a 

milestone in the life of a retiree. 

Though statistically, longevity of life 

has increased, we are coming across 

several instances where many souls 

depart from us even before reaching 

the above milestone. Under such  

circumstances, it is really a cause for  

greeting the retirees who are set to 

reach the milestone and enthuse 

them to tread along. With this 

objective and in response to desires 

of several members that CBROA 

News features a list of members who 

are crossing 75 years of age during 

NOVEMBER 2024. 

    

3882 S MANOKARAN 19819 CHENNAI 15-11-1949 9840885791

4917 M S KAMATH 9166 GURUVAYANA KERE 17-11-1949 9481213677

4996 R SRIDHARAN 7337 CHENNAI 17-11-1949 9381020085

1630 SHARMA J V R 14392 BENGALURU 19-11-1949 9845266362

2524 PARSAI KANHAIYALAL 13836 INDORE 19-11-1949 9826537986

3768 P VISHWANATH SHENOY 9307 MANGALURU 19-11-1949 8050922405

1351 KENCHAPPA C R 12220 PATTANAYAKANAHALLI 20-11-1949 9448159235

4176 R K KHURANA 50320 NEW DELHI 20-11-1949 9999087235

9323 K HARI 27189 BENGALURU 21-11-1949 7338132086

1265 BHASKARA P 14357 MANIPAL 22-11-1949 9448296758

2940 RAO R S 9430 BENGALURU 22-11-1949 9900161061

9618 ANNA BHANUDAS ADHAU 25842 ULHASNAGAR 22-11-1949 9049087220

4150 SANTOSH M BAADKAR 19011 FATORDA - GOA 24-11-1949 9689159216

5319 N K VARADEENDRA 14738 BENGALURU 24-11-1949 9242032694

5526 S PADMANABHAN 17707 BENGALURU 24-11-19499880244822 / 08026710681

3023 SRINIVASA K 9446 MYSURU 26-11-1949 9448049860

3595 Ms SMITHA B KINARE 12077 MUMBAI 26-11-1949 7021626775

1808 DILIP KUMAR C G 11834 BENGALURU 28-11-1949 9845157881

2266 SADASHIVAM S 10608 CHENNAI 28-11-1949 9840994366

2976 NAIK M N 16341 BENGALURU 29-11-1949 9945171581

76 JANAK A K T 9944 SECUNDERABAD 30-11-1949 9849985803

SEPTUAGENARIANS
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RETIREMENT DURING THE MONTH OF NOVEMBER 2024 
EMPLID NAME GRADEDPCD BRANCH DOB MOBILE

59815 SATISH KUMAR OF3 2151 FEROZEPUR WAIRA 16-11-1964 9560474191

64495 BANKEY LAL CLK 2151 FEROZEPUR WAIRA 09-11-1964 9457241930

437035 NARESH KUMAR KASHYAP SBS 18792 MOHKAMPUR 05-11-1964 8859998832

57364 UJJWAL KUMAR TEWARY OF4 2698 BENGALURU RNR II BLOCK 01-12-1964 8334999232

57661 K GOPALA OF4 7961 MYSURU RO 10-11-1964 9448721683

57675 BABU A S OF1 8087 BENGALURU HO CC 01-12-1964 9901101666

58800 S BADRINATH OF4 787 BENGALURU KODANDARAMAPURAM 18-11-1964 9448834813

75154 S RAJAVELU CLK 6781 BENGALURU BWSSB BRANCH 30-11-1964 9980501466

73696 CHAMPA LAL CLK 17870 RATLAM MANEK CHOWK 16-11-1964 9406686809

497495 PURNACH PRADHAN OF1 6104 ATTABIRA 15-11-1964 9937201502

55061 PUSHPA KUMARI CLK 4599 NAHAN 12-11-1964 9805741115

59978 MOHAN LAL OF1 6067 AJITWAL 19-11-1964 9814025422

74596 AVTAR SINGH CLK 2399 CHANDIGARH SECTOR 44-C 10-11-1964 9417258797

76199 ROOP CHAND OF1 2719 HOSHIARPUR VVRI SADHU ASHRAM 03-11-1964 7018977506

52917 V RAVEENDRAN OF3 7995 COIMBATORE-I RO 03-11-1964 8903611364

57916 D DHANASEKARAN SBS 973 CHENNAI ABHIRAMAPURAM 07-11-1964 9444056267

63618 NAIR AJIT KRISHNAN OF8 7200 CHENNAI CO 22-11-1964 9740810508

63715 G LEELA CLK 2412 CHENNAI PADI 24-11-1964 8056040905

68870 S VINAYAGAMOORTHY CLK 970 CHENNAI PERAMBUR BARRACKS ROAD 21-11-1964 9566156543

73267 RAGHU A SBS 1283 CHENNAI HABIBULLAH ROAD 16-11-1964 7904836794

74692 S VENKATESH CLK 8088 CHENNAI-II CC 23-11-1964 9444974573

78587 N SAMUEL RAJ PRABAKARAN CLK 5544 ERODE SOLAR 02-11-1964 9941369860

457187 SELVAM G OF4 1027 VELLAKOVIL 01-12-1964 9449028322

55448 POONAM K SINGH OF2 348 DELHI OKHLA SSI INDL ESTATE 30-11-1964 9759010582

55534 RAJESH KUMAR ARORA CLK 2591 DELHI SARITA VIHAR 17-11-1964 9891998239

450447 POONAM BAWEJA CLK 1170 DELHI SHAKTINAGAR 20-11-1964 9811715305

455637 NEETA SATSANGI CLK 2455 DELHI VIKASPURI 11-11-1964 9811155901

AGRA CIRCLE

BENGALURU CIRCLE

BHOPAL CIRCLE

BHUBANESHWAR CIRCLE

CHANDIGARH CIRCLE

CHENNAI CIRCLE

DELHI CIRCLE
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RETIREMENT DURING THE MONTH OF NOVEMBER 2024 

75270 ASWANI KUMAR TALUKDAR SBS 17340 BIJOY NAGAR 01-12-1964 8638810063

55991 D PRAVEENKUMAR OF1 58005 PART OF HO, MANIPAL 25-11-1964 8971568269

64775 A ELANGO SUBRAMANIAN OF4 401 HO BENGALURU 05-11-1964 9003305606

69259 A RAJESWARI CLK 401 HO BENGALURU 01-12-1964 7259449907

58976 LAXMI PALMARI SBS 12821 HUBBALLI CC 18-11-1964 9632053674

479136 ROBERT D' SILVA OF5 7695 HUBBALLI CO 27-11-1964 9482579768

484507 RAVASAHEB RAMA KERIKAI SBS 10536 ATHANI 01-12-1964 9538517688

57065 K BALAJI OF2 12822 HYDERABAD CC 09-11-1964 9951333109

64042 V V RAMANA RAO CLK 6108 HYDERABAD VENGALA RAO NAGAR 25-11-1964 9704402234

58710 DIVYA BANSAL CLK 18202 PANCHKULA MOTIRAM A M P SCHOOL 25-11-1964 9876067722

466709 ASHU BHALLA CLK 2046 KARNAL 08-11-1964 9467581184

484600 KIRAN NARANG CLK 18243 GURGAON SUKHRALI 22-11-1964 9818113523

62356 GAUTAM DAS SBS 8057 KOLKATA JADAVPUR CC 22-11-1964 9433440896

62502 J K HALDAR CLK 19592 KOLKATA DHARMATOLLA 23-11-1964 9433171456

62634 CHANDRA PAL CLK 2873 LUCKNOW IRRIGATION DEPARTMENT 02-11-1964 8887796452

575766 SURENDER SBS 12831 LUCKNOW CC 25-11-1964 9889461814

46046 SANTHI G OF2 8337 MADURAI RO 12-11-1964 9994523202

66944 KUMARAN B OF4 16202 DINDIGUL NAGALNAGAR 20-11-1964 9486324789

537506 M PAUL MARIA THEEBARAJ CLK 16360 TIRUCHIRAPALLI 21-11-1964 9629947092

62584 PURUSHOTHAMA CLK 1394 MANGALURU HOIGE BAZAAR 02-11-1964 9980663089

448473 JOYCE E M PINTO CLK 10105 MANGALORE KADRI 02-11-1964 9449835920

58841 G P PRABHU OF3 8351 UDUPI RO 12-11-1964 9448085074

440026 NARASIMHA G ANKOLEKAR OF1 2941 SIRSI HUBBALLI ROAD 06-11-1964 9449769703

KOLKATA CIRCLE

LUCKNOW CIRCLE

MADURAI CIRCLE

MANGALURU CIRCLE

MANIPAL CIRCLE

KARNAL CIRCLE

GUWAHATI CIRCLE

HO BENGALURU

HUBBALLI CIRCLE

HYDERABAD CIRCLE
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RETIREMENT DURING THE MONTH OF NOVEMBER 2024 

46536 A A GOKHALE CLK 249 DOMBIVILLI WEST 10-11-1964 9022448182

48693 GEETA S KANTAK  OF1 15006 MUMBAI MULUND 17-11-1964 9757148345

53066 UMA SUBRAMANIAN OF1 7064 RAH MUMBAI VIDYA VIHAR 19-11-1964 9819003698

57483 SANJAY J ATHAWALE CLK 2630 MUMBAI CUFFE PARADE LCB 12-11-1964 9820401802

60572 C V NAIK CLK 15022 MUMBAI ANDHERI (WEST) 15-11-1964 9890393640

60586 P V SHETTY CLK 217 KALWA 06-11-1964 9702575942

73525 HANUMANT B GHUTUGADE SBS 3044 CBD BELAPUR NAVI MUMBAI 07-11-1964 9004967558

418999 MALATHI D BANGERA OF1 3166 MUMBAI BORIVILI (EAST) 26-11-1964 9004863332

475572 MEENAKSHI MURALIDHARAN CLK 236 MUMBAI GHATKOPAR EAST 07-11-1964 9833873490

519306 SANJAY G VETURKAR SBS 15503 USGAON 02-11-1964 9004900261

519317 SUNIL T MOHITE CLK 264 ULHASNAGAR 5 10-11-1964 9975565963

61256 AKSHAY KUMAR BHAGAT OF1 5744 HUSAINABAD BHAGHALPUR 22-11-1964 9430425622

49275 S B KAMBLE OF3 8355 PUNE RO 28-11-1964 9158912398

70471 D B CHAVAN SBS 310 SHOLAPUR CHATIGALLI MAIN 10-11-1964 9850776431

405090 PARODKAR ASHOK KISHANRAO CLK 15137 CHHATRAPATI SAMBHAJINAGAR T V CEN10-11-1964 9423724335

73538 ALKANANDA ROY CLK 2959 KUSAI COLONY BRANCH RANCHI 25-11-1964 9973511412

68476 RENUKA K T SBS 859 VALANCHERRY 01-12-1964 2640832

506902 GOPIKRISHNA OF1 726 KASARGOD JALSOOR ROAD 13-11-1964 9495180174

PATNA CIRCLE

PUNE CIRCLE

RANCHI CIRCLE

TRIVANDRUM CIRCLE

MUMBAI CIRCLE
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NEW LIFE MEMBERS ENROLLED DURING THE MONTH – OCTOBER 2024 

Mem NoName Staff No Scale DOB Mobile State

14767 S SASIKALA 54237 OF1 22-09-1964 9840768077 TAMIL NADU

14768 BALAMURALICHANDER L 58375 OF1 11-10-1964 9740143789 KARNATAKA

14769 NIROJ KUMAR DORA 57264 OF2 20-01-1966 8249936746 ODISHA

14770 ASHOK KUMAR MEHER 59696 OF4 22-09-1964 8100139166 ODISHA

14771 M PARTHIBAN 55793 OF1 10-09-1964 9248064964 TAMIL NADU

14772 MARY SUJATHA 45455 OF2 10-03-1960 6361238969 KARNATAKA

14773 M M KAMBLE 25828 OF1 02-06-1952 9892793711 MAHARASHTRA

14774 SUDHA R V 58169 OF2 23-09-1964 9632308460 KARNATAKA

14775 ANANDARAJ N 62308 OF2 26-05-1970 8277421022 KARNATAKA

14776 S J GAWARE 56456 OF8 21-09-1964 8454848566 KARNATAKA

14777 SUSHIL KUMAR C R 445445 OF5 30-09-1964 7338836195 KARNATAKA

14778 RITANJALI SAHOO 73906 OF2 12-04-1979 9937316777 ODISHA

14779 N S NAGENDRA 55511 OF3 05-05-1966 8970874443 KARNATAKA

14780 K K BALRAJ 70878 OF4 02-05-1966 9448267753 KERALA

14781 ANIL KUMAR MEHTA 49638 OF1 01-09-1951 9873181224 DELHI

14782 CHANDER SHEKHAR VERMA 58186 OF1 29-03-1969 9953520196 DELHI

14783 NATARAJAN K.E 10309 OF3 27-10-1949 9731125573 KARNATAKA

14784 K UMESH SHANBHOGUE 10258 OF2 25-04-1946 9886814282 KARNATAKA

14785 B RAVINDRA RAO, 145932 OF2 15-06-1953 9449590008 KARNATAKA

14786 T NAGARAJ 30493 OF3 15-04-1958 9663752428 KARNATAKA

14787 GURURAJ B BAGALKOT S103417 OF1 27-07-1951 9480552424 KARNATAKA

14788 W T SURESH KUMAR 458171 OF5 19-09-1964 8861921660 KARNATAKA

14789 GANESH CHANDRA SARKAR 58908 OF5 08-10-1964 9334998484 WEST BENGAL

14790 KRISHNARAJ K 42060 OF2 22-07-1962 8892047803 KARNATAKA

14791 SIVA PRASAD T 60652 OF4 15-09-1964 8050969119 KARNATAKA

14792 P PRIYADARSHI 56466 OF1 11-12-1965 9431086947 BIHAR

14793 R N SRINIVASAN 5910 OF4 09-03-1944 9916614985 KARNATAKA

14794 D SREEKUMAR 25878 OF3 25-11-1953 9495119654 KERALA

14795 P RAVI VARMA 52419 OF7 01-10-1964 9182915181 TELANGANA

14796 MONICA SABRINA, 295914 OF3 17-12-1959 7337839714 KARNATAKA

14797 PREMALATHA KAMATH, 301585 OF2 02-05-1959 9242988029 KARNATAKA

14798 K SANTHOSH KAMATH, 201058 OF7 26-09-1955 9591000299 KARNATAKA

14799 VASANTHI S RAGHAVAN 55972 OF4 06-11-1966 9448809997 KARNATAKA

14800 K MOHAN CHANDRAN 17727 OF7 13-09-1950 9645854952 KERALA

14801 S VIJAYALAKSHMI 53940 OF1 15-10-1964 9868222580 DELHI

14802 K ASWATH, 25010 OF4 01-06-1955 9449817852 KARNATAKA

14803 N JEEVAGAN 10818 OF7 16-04-1950 8826310029 HARYANA  
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NEW LIFE MEMBERS ENROLLED DURING THE MONTH – OCTOBER 2024 

Mem NoName Staff No Scale DOB Mobile State

14804 SURAJ DEO PRASAD SINGH 27675 OF3 01-03-1957 8709939892 JHARKHAND

14805 SHIV KUMAR PRASAD 45405 OF4 07-02-1962 7607596950 UTTAR PRADESH

14806 S N K NAIR 1005 OF5 21-07-1931 9446557157 KERALA

14807 J RABINDRANATH 11446 OF7 22-08-1952 7093963987 TELANGANA

14808 K SURENDRA REDDY, 359720 OF3 05-04-1958 9398151836 ANDHRA PRADESH

14809 LAXMI NARAYAN BAMMIGATT 65256 OF1 23-06-1969 9480055229 KARNATAKA

14810 SUNANDA R NAYAK, 300052 OF5 13-05-1959 7620737690 KARNATAKA

14811 K S KARUNAKARA, 396505 OF6 28-06-1959 9742056270 KARNATAKA

14812 K G SRINIVASAN 46916 OF1 11-11-1962 9880480607 KARNATAKA

14813 M NARASIMHA PAI S2435 OF3 22-12-1934 9845741551 KARNATAKA

14814 RADHAI BASKARAN 45931 OF1 12-04-1958 9790778940 TAMIL NADU

14815 DEEPTI H GODBOLE 56689 OF1 12-05-1966 9423438672 MAHARASHTRA

14816 VENKATESAN R 63609 OF4 21-09-1964 9444926451 TAMIL NADU

14817 RAJESH N GOKARN 55979 OF2 26-10-1964 9483648505 KARNATAKA

14818 ARVIND KAPOOR 49600 OF5 26-12-1963 9868177307 NEW DELHI

14819 SWAMI SHARAN NATH, 456735 OF2 13-08-1963 9910428365 UTTAR PRADESH

14820 CAPT K RAMAN 5698 OF7 20-02-1939 9742258523 KARNATAKA

14821 HUBERT NORONHA 7831 OF5 14-12-1946 9341094823 KARNATAKA

14822 HAMPAPURA CHAYAPATI GOP 23852 OF1 28-09-1953 9845981953 KARNATAKA

14823 B S NAGARAJ SINGH 17350 OF4 29-04-1954 9480038798 KARNATAKA

14824 M JANARDHAN, 459039 OF5 23-11-1960 9704112647 KARNATAKA

14825 V R MURTHY 25624 OF3 22-04-1952 9900195624 KARNATAKA

14826 S HARESHA BABU, 416542 OF6 20-04-1959 9449208484 KARNATAKA

14827 P K SARACHANDRAN 31749 OF3 12-11-1956 8921371035 KERALA

14828 B GOVARDHAN KAMATH, 197731 OF2 02-08-1953 8879219431 KARNATAKA

14829 D R SHANKAR RAO 10931 OF1 22-01-1948 9972903366 KARNATAKA

14830 M GREGORY 30462 OF1 30-11-1953 9821147725 MAHARASHTRA

14831 T SURENDRANATHAN 29883 OF5 04-10-1956 9769011832 KARNATAKA

14832 T N SUNDARAN 11762 OF6 24-01-1949 9987326475 MAHARASHTRA

14833 SHANTHA RANGASWAMY, 18219 OF7 01-01-1954 9035006994 KARNATAKA

14834 V KALPANA 35190 OF1 10-09-1959 9448062945 KARNATAKA

14835 RENU R S 71245 OF4 9847947006 KERALA

14836 REKHA KINI, 123732 OF3 01-06-1948 9449631431 KARNATAKA

14837 REVATHI SUDHAKAR 64128 OF4 21-05-1971 8105481010 KARNATAKA

14838 MINAKSHI KALIA 58188 OF3 19-12-1969 8828235400 MAHARASHTRA

14839 MITA DAS 17564 OF2 26-09-1950 9830445506 WEST BENGAL

14840 ESWARAMURTHY L 55568 OF3 04-10-1964 9443478512 TAMIL NADU  
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NEW LIFE MEMBERS ENROLLED DURING THE MONTH – OCTOBER 2024 

Mem NoName Staff No Scale DOB Mobile State

14841 R PONNUSWAMY 49226 OF2 03-04-1959 6304697297 TAMIL NADU

14842 RAJESWARI R 65011 OF1 20-06-1974 9942473113 TAMIL NADU

14843 B NARASIMHA RAO 1794 OF1 06-06-1938 8197329919 KARNATAKA

14844 K A NAGENDRA RAO 60068 OF3 24-09-1949 9945272333 KARNATAKA

14845 VIDYA V KAMATH 128999 OF1 17-05-1953 9898018797 KARNATAKA

14846 V P RANGARAJAN 19308 OF5 11-05-1953 9962300741 TAMIL NADU

14847 PRAKASH V NAIK  21345 OF3 04-11-1951 9821429842 KARNATAKA

14848 T V SESHAGIRI 70764 OF4 30-08-1975 9866420865 ANDHRA PRADESH

14849 MAHENDRA VISHNU PAGARE,388173 OF2 10-12-1960 9011515685 MAHARASHTRA

14850 V R BALAVISWANATHAN 37371 OF1 13-11-1954 9916952635 TAMIL NADU

14851 M PALANIVELU, 294827 OF4 22-02-1953 9448557515 KARNATAKA

14852 GOPALAKRISHNA L 63251 OF3 KARNATAKA

14853 K PANKAJA 457664 OF3 18-07-1965 9886369050 KARNATAKA

14854 E MUKUNDAN 13599 OF2 20-11-1949 8078421530 KERALA

14855 C B RAMANATH 18156 OF1 25-05-1954 9886715204 KARNATAKA

14856 ABHAY KUMAR 502038 OF7 15-08-1964 9340666010 UTTAR PRADESH

14857 V RAJAGOPAL  9879 OF1 01-01-1948 9650289595 HARYANA

14858 GEETHA K S 65151 OF1 12-01-1971 9844594440 KARNATAKA

14859 RACHANA KAMAL GALANI 57482 OF1 06-10-1964 9767249823 MAHARASHTRA

14860 P MOHANDAS 19025 OF1 10-08-1954 9632189766 KARNATAKA

14861 SAMARENDRA KUMAR PARIDA318211 OF4 23-02-1955 7381094050 ODISHA

14862 UMESH KUMAR BHALLA 53578 OF7 29-09-1964 9463540397 PUNJAB

14863 JAVARAYEE, 27110 OF1 05-02-1952 9535320003 KARNATAKA

14864 VIDYADHAR S KHANDIT 52640 OF3 30-10-1964 9902584350 MAHARASHTRA

14865 MANOHAR J SALINS 199029 OF3 9448261379 KARNATAKA

14866 JYOTHI KAMATH 23575 OF2 07-10-1955 9449064643 KARNATAKA  
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CBROA has been assisting members though in small measure, as an expression of 

solidarity with the beleaguered members at the hour of their grief/crisis. The entire scheme 

is borne mostly out of generous Donations from the members. While the CBROA thanks the 

donors for and on behalf of all the beneficiaries, it seeks generous and regular donations in 

this endeavour to stand by the members at their time of need. CBROA appeals to members 

for regular donations on the occasion of birthday celebration of their dear ones, say – Self, 

Spouse, Children, and Grandchildren and derive satisfaction of donating for a cause.  

Medical Relief paid during the month of October 2024. 

CBROA MEDICAL RELIEF DISBURSEMENTS OCTOBER  2024 

Sl 
M. 

No. 
Name  Staff No. Place 

Self/ 

Spouse 
Amount 

1 5361 KITTU NAIK 28288 UDUPI SELF 30000 

2 1777 C S CHITRAPURUSH 25363 BENGALURU SELF 30000 

TOTAL AMOUNT DISBURSED 60000 

 

Dear friends, 

Many members are voluntarily opting out of CBROA welfare scheme (Medical 

reimbursement scheme) and sending mails, WhatsApp messages. We are finding it 

difficult to consolidate. Hence, we have devised a google form to enable us to consolidate 

it. Please use the below mentioned link, in case if you wish to opt out  of the welfare 

scheme. 

 

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfWqCEh_u4aKy_KNrm9s_Dw8hAOfERsD7JOsHQkvJHeqle8M

w/viewform?usp=pp_url&entry.740508370=Yes  

 

Jagadeesh J S 

General Secretary 

 

 

CBROA WELFARE SCHEMES 

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfWqCEh_u4aKy_KNrm9s_Dw8hAOfERsD7JOsHQkvJHeqle8Mw/viewform?usp=pp_url&entry.740508370=Yes
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfWqCEh_u4aKy_KNrm9s_Dw8hAOfERsD7JOsHQkvJHeqle8Mw/viewform?usp=pp_url&entry.740508370=Yes
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DATE NAME STF NO LM NO AMT (Rs)RECEIPTDIST

02-10-2024 GEETHA V KAMATH AM 373 AM373 5000 56134 HYDERABAD

05-10-2024 ASHA RAMAN 9539 3353 75000 56135 BENGALURU

06-10-2024 H KRISHNAMURTHY 17283 3048 1075 56137 BENGALURU

07-10-2024 M S MAHABALA 20600 3818 2000 56145 BENGALURU

07-10-2024 B S NATARAJA 30511 7412 10000 56144 BENGALURU

07-10-2024 P B GANAPATHY 35283 7665 2000 56143 BENGALURU

07-10-2024 G S CHANDRASEKHARAN 6598 4600 5000 56141 COIMBATORE

07-10-2024 P R SESHAGIRI 6818 3149 5000 56140 BENGALURU

07-10-2024 B SHAM BHATTA 8299 2874 1100 56139 BENGALURU

07-10-2024 S SATHYAMURTHY 8435 2095 2000 56138 THANJAVUR

08-10-2024 SRIDHARA S P 42777 6764 2000 56151 BENGALURU

08-10-2024 UMANATH JAVALE 14886 3456 3000 56150 BENGALURU

08-10-2024 K ANANTHRAMAN 20659 11562 2001 56149 BENGALURU

08-10-2024 R G PAVASKAR 8244 2543 8101 56148 BENGALURU

08-10-2024 S C KANADE 21263 7031 1000 56147 BENGALURU

08-10-2024 P R L ACHAR S3980 13893 1000 56146 UDUPI

11-10-2024 S I SAHEB 1387 5907 3000 56152 THANE

16-10-2024 R ASHFAQ AHMED KHAN 10305 1280 1001 56155 BENGALURU

16-10-2024 S F HALLUR 27100 10823 2501 56154 BELAGAVI

16-10-2024 S N PANDE 30615 8335 500 56153 PUNE

18-10-2024 N CHANDRASHEKAR 1620 3639 10000 56159 BENGALURU

18-10-2024 K NAGARAJA RAO 12767 487 5000 56158 BENGALURU

18-10-2024 VASUNDHARA B KUMAR 9924 1518 5000 56157 BENGALURU

18-10-2024 M M KHWAJA 25049 2967 7000 56156 MUMBAI

19-10-2024 K LEELA AM2507 FP 1000 56160 PALAKKAD

21-10-2024 CASH DEP 750 BENGALURU

22-10-2024 V SHARADA 21316 9031 2500 56161 THANE

23-10-2024 NAGARAJA RAO S 21267 7234 1000 56164 BENGALURU

23-10-2024 T S KUMAR 18902 11853 1000 56163 BENGALURU

23-10-2024 B K GURUMURTHY 10076 4245 3000 56162 BENGALURU

24-10-2024 AVINASH PHANSALKAR 8110 3370 5000 56165 PUNE

26-10-2024 ANJALEE RAJAN WALINJKAR 37898 5761 5000 56167 THANE

26-10-2024 C R N VARMA 45355 10006 2000 56166 HYDERABAD

28-10-2024 S S BIVIJI 13567 7580 10000 56170 MUMBAI

28-10-2024 G B KULKARNI 7612 3000 6000 56169 BENGALURU

28-10-2024 VIDYA SATISH AM444 AM 150 56168 DAKSHINA KANNADA

29-10-2024 M G N NAYAK 12167 5322 2000 56171 BENGALURU

30-10-2024 SHIV KUMAR PRASAD 45405 14805 500 56175 LUCKNOW

30-10-2024 P K SARACHANDRAN 31749 14827 500 56174 KOTTAYAM

30-10-2024 J K GUPTA 50826 4725 2100 56173 GAUTAM BUDDHA NAGAR

30-10-2024 PRADEEP PRAKASH 35223 11406 200 56172 AMROHA

31-10-2024 CHANDRESH VASANTLAL BHATT 43556 11851 2000 56177 MUMBAI

31-10-2024 DARSHNA C BHATT 46358 14713 3000 56176 MUMBAI  

 

DONATION RECEIVED DURING THE 

MONTH – OCTOBER 2024 
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CBROA MEMBERS’ CONTACT INFORMATION - UPDATE 

Dear Members, 

Please find the Link (Sign in removed) to update your latest address, email and mobile 

number.  Please use the same in case there is any change in your Contact information. 

 

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfwTFvPqmP2nuZMktMj3VhDyhU4-

JaO5gSL02H5MkifCYsYIg/viewform?usp=sf_link  

 

Jagadeesh J S 

General Secretary 

 

 

 

 

 

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfwTFvPqmP2nuZMktMj3VhDyhU4-JaO5gSL02H5MkifCYsYIg/viewform?usp=sf_link
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfwTFvPqmP2nuZMktMj3VhDyhU4-JaO5gSL02H5MkifCYsYIg/viewform?usp=sf_link
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               AGRA REGION                                       AHMEDABAD REGION                      BENGALURU REGION 

    
                                                                      BAREILY REGION 

    
                                                                     ERNAKULAM REGION 

   
ERNAKULAM REGION                                                      GHAZIA BAD REGION 

   
                                                                        GHAZIABAD REGION 
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KOLKATA REGION 

    

   
KERALA – KANNUR                                                                     MUMBAI REGION 

   
                                                                          MYSURU REGION 

     
                                                                                 ODISHA REGION 
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                                          ODISHA REGION                                                      PATNA REGION 

    
                                                                             PATNA REGION 

    

   
PATNA REGION                                                                            SHIVAMOGGA REGION     

   
                                                                                PUNE REGION 
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                                                                                 PUNE REGION 

    

    

    

    

                                                                         UTTARA KANNADA REGION 
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MUQTCHAND PROGRAMME – PUNE 

    

    

    

   
 

 


