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JUNE 2025 

FROM THE DESK OF GENERAL SECRETARY 

 

 

          Dear Members/,Associate 
Members. 
 
The IBA and UFBU have decided 
to commence discussions on 
implementation of Group 
Mediclaim Policy for the Bank 
retirees and in-service employees 
for the ensuing year. The Retirees' 
Organisations including our apex 
body AIBPARC had represented 
to the IBA and Government to 
extend reimbursement of medical 
expenses to retirees also as in the 
case of serving employees. Our 
argument is based on the fact that 

the retired employees of Central 
Government, Railways, Defence 
forces besides many public sector 
undertakings are enjoying the 
facility. During the previous year 
the IBA agreed to bring the 
serving employees and retirees 
under one health insurance policy. 
This resulted in floating a Group 
Mediclaim Policy at a very 
affordable premium for the 
retirees. Our Bank mitigated the 
hardship of pensioners by 
subsidizing the Insurance 
premium to the extent of Rs 
6,000/- per pensioner. 
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The small gesture from the 
Management of our Bank 
notwithstanding, IBA has violated 
the directive issued by the 
Department of Financial Services, 
Ministry of Finance vide their letter 
No F No.14/7/92-II(Vol II) dated 
24.02.2012 addressed to IBA 
which states as per its essence 
that, it should be one Policy and 
premium is to be paid by the 
respective banks for both serving 
employees and retirees from their 
respective Welfare Fund, instead 
of reimbursing cash. A common 
policy was floated but the premium 
for the serving employees was 
absorbed by the bank and the 
premium in case of retirees was to 
be borne by the retirees 
themselves out of their meagre 
pension which is not revised or 
updated since 1995 inspire of 
several representations to the IBA 
and Government of India.  
 
When the Scheme was introduced 
IBA advocated and convinced the 
poor retirees that the scheme was 
the best one with lower, affordable 
premium. But later we realised 
that the premium on the policy 
increased exorbitantly, step by 
step, over the years, compelling a 
large number of retirees to opt out 
of the policy as they could not just 
afford the burden of the premium 
amount. Coupled with this the 
Domiciliary treatment facility with 
Super Top Up policy for 
reimbursement of cost of 

medicines, the retirees had to pay 
unjustifiably high premium. The 
Domiciliary treatment 
reimbursement was restricted to 
10% of the insured amount as 
against the exorbitant premium 
amount. This had no rationale or 
logic as the premium for 
reimbursement of expenses 
incurred for domiciliary treatment 
was far in excess of the amount to 
be reimbursed. 
 
Adding fuel to the fire, levying 18% 
GST on the premium amount has 
made the policy more 
unaffordable. The increased 
premium rates, especially in 
higher age group forces the senior 
retirees to choose the exit route.  
 
Contrary to the common belief that 
the Group Mediclaim Policies are 
cheaper compared to retail 
policies, the Insurance Companies 
have been resorting to hike in 
premium rates on an ad-hoc basis 
on the pretext of ever-increasing 
medical costs and thus making the 
Group policy unaffordable. 
 
The adverse Net Incurred Claim 
Ratio (NICR) I e the excess 
amount paid over the premium 
amount received in a year is the 
chief argument of the insurers for 
a hike in premium. The NICR 
crucially depends on number and 
amount of claims while the 
percentage of claims to total policy 
remains the same, contrary to this 
the claim amount has been on the 
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rise due to reported increase in 
service costs of the hospitals. This 
aspect needs to be revisited as 
there is no uniformity and 
transparency among the 
networked hospitals with regards 
to treatment of ailments and 
charges thereof. The nexus 
between networked hospitals and 
Third Party Agents (TPAs) is also 
to be looked into while examining 
the reasons for escalation in 
hospital costs.  
 
NEED OF THE HOUR. 
 
The important components of cost 
of Health Insurance Policy are 
claims, operating expenses and 
taxes. On implementation of GST 
regime, the tax component has 
increased from 15% to 18% which 
is a big burden on the retirees. 
Health care being the priority on 
the Government agenda, taxing 
the retirees is not fair. Government 
need to revisit their stand on 
levying GST on Health Insurance 
premium and initiate steps to bring 
down GST to zero. 
 
The argument of the Insurance 
companies is that they are forced 
to hike the premium on account of 
increased claims coupled with 
medical inflation. Since the policy 
holder base is broadened by 
covering the serving employees 
and retirees, naturally the number 
of claims will be on the rise. The 
adverse claim ratio as reported by 
the Insurance companies is not on 

account of increased number of 
cases but high value claims. The 
principal reason for this is not 
having uniform rates for each 
ailment/disease and the treatment 
cost varies from hospital to 
hospital within a city /town. 
Further, it is a well-known fact that 
the Health Card Holder will be 
charged more compared to normal 
cash payment, by the Corporate 
Hospitals. Thus, monetary cap on 
ailments and uniform billing with 
health card or without health card 
is the need of the hour. 
 
The IBA and UFBU have been 
urged to keep the above facts in 
mind while having a discussion on 
the Group Mediclaim Policy for the 
serving employees and retirees, to 
be floated for the ensuing year. 
Our apex body AIBPARC has 
been relentlessly campaigning for 
absorption of the premium amount 
by the Bank. 
 
Life is full of uncertainties but 
"Ageing" us certain. Each one of 
us invariably undergoes the cycle 
and finally joins the super senior 
category. Consequently, the age 
related ailments will be the order 
of the day and these need to be 
addressed suitably.  
 
The retirees of Banking Industry 
are known for their hard work, 
sacrifices, dedication and devotion 
to the organisation's goals and 
objectives and their contribution to 
the nation building is invaluable. It 
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is not out of place to mention that 
the retirees of Banking industry 
are the most law -abiding citizens 
and have been genuinely paying 
taxes all through their service. 
"RESPECT ELDERS" though has 
resonance in various forums but 
very little is done in letter and 
spirit. We are forced to look up to 
the Government and our beloved 
Bank not for any freebies or 

charity but for a deserving health 
coverage to continue our journey 
in our twilight years with peace 
and dignity. 
 
We wish our members health, 
happiness and a joyous time for all 
the days ahead. 
 
J S Jagadeesh           Bengaluru 
General Secretary     08.06.2025 
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CIRCULAR NO. GIST OF THE CIRCULAR ISSUED DURING JANUARY 2025 

35/2025 

02-05-2025 

The city of Guwahati witnessed hectic organizational activities of AIBPARC and its affiliates 

on two consecutive days – the state committee of Assam held its triennial conference on 

26th April, 2025 being preceded by the holding of the Triennial conference of Central Bank 

Retired Officers’ Association in the morning of the same day and succeeded by the Triennial 
conference of All India PNB Pensioners Association on the next day. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_35-25.pdf  

36/2025 

03-05-2025 

A general meeting of Bank Pensioners & Retirees organized at Vijayawada on 1st May, 2025. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_36-25.pdf  

37/2025 

29-03-2025 

 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_37-25.pdf  

38/2025 

31-03-2025 

Co 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_38-25.pdf  

39/2025 

17-05-2025 

Group medical insurance scheme for the Bank Pensioners and the Retirees for the year 

November 2025 to October 2026. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_39-25.pdf   

40/2025 

20-05-2025 

Consultative Status to the Apex Level Bank Retirees’ Organizations. 
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_40-25.pdf  

41/2025 

23-05-2025 

Group Medical Insurance Scheme for Bank Retirees for the year November, 2025 to 

October, 2026. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_41-25.pdf  

42/2025 

24-05-2025 

Health Insurance scheme for Bank Retirees for the year November 2025 to October 2026. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_42-25.pdf 

43/2025 

25-05-2025 

The city of Thiruvananthapuram witnessed hectic organizational activities of AIBPARC on 

16th & 17th May, 2025. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_43-25.pdf 

44/2025 

26-05-2025 

AIBPARC, West Bengal State Unit, organized 4th Triennial General Body & conference on 

22nd May, 2025 in its characteristic way. 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_44-25.pdf 

 

AIBPARC, West Bengal State Committee Tri-ennial Conference was held on 

22/05/2025 at Ajit Sen Bhawan, Kolkata. The meeting was presided over by State 

Committee President and was attended by 180 delegates and observer. From our Bank 

Sri Asit Ranjan Rakshit, Sri Bhuban Chandra Pramanik, Sri Swapan Haldar, Sri 

Shyamal Kumar Sinha and Sri Prabir Chakraborty attended the meeting. The State 

Committee Secretary, Sri Suprita Sarkar presented his report before the august House 

AIBPARC NEWS 

https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_35-25.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_36-25.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_37-25.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_38-25.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_39-25.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_40-25.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_41-25.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_42-25.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_43-25.pdf
https://aibprc.co.in/pdf/circularno_44-25.pdf
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and was accepted unanimously after deliberation by 20 delegates from different banks. 

From our CBROA Sri Swapan Haldar, CC Member and Sri Asit Ranjan Rakshit, VP, 

deleberated on GS report. The books of accounts and Auditor’s report was presented 
before the house and was accepted unanimously. A state committee was formed with 

81 members. Sri Suprita Sarkar was unanimously elected as General Secretary of West 

Bengal State Committee and from our bank Sri Asit Ranjan Rakshit was elected as 

Senior Vice President, Sri Swapan Haldar was elected as Deputy Secretary and Sri 

Shyamal Kumar Sinha was elected as Executive Committee Member of West Bengal 

State Committee. 

The meeting was concluded with vote of thanks and  National Anthem. 

  

    
 

JHARKHAND 

 

AIBPARC, Hazaribagh District Unit of Jharkhand State held its meeting on May 15, at 

Arya Kanya Vidyalay Gurukul, Nawabganj. CBROA members Sri Anant Krishna and Sri 

Ajay Kumar participated in the capacity as President and an office bearer, respectively. 

Other CBROA members also attended the meeting there. The meeting was attended by 

as many as 50 members from different affiliates. AIBPARC, Hazaribag Dist Vice 

President Sri T P Padar and Dist Secy Sri Brinda Prasad replied to various queries 

raised in the meeting. Sri Hitnath Jha, AIBPARC, Jharkhand Region Dy State Secy also 
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participated in the deliberations. Besides local issues, participants discussed about 

pension updation and benefits to all above 70 years of age under Ayushmaan Bharat 

scheme.  

The meeting concluded with a vote of thanks by our member Sri Ajay Kumar. 
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REGIONAL  

ROUNDUP 

PHOTOS ARE POSTED IN THE “PHOTOS GALLERY” 

 

AHMEDABAD 
On 11th of May 2025, Team Ahmedabad 

felicitated Shri D M Shah (STF No 9715 

LM No.4310) on his completing 75 years 

of age.  They offered him a bouquet of 

flowers and Shawl. On this occasion, 

following Office Bearers and local 

Committee members remaiNed present 

with Spouse. 1.Shri J G Parmar, AGS, 

CBROA. Shri T I Shah, Local Cpmmittee 

Chairman, Local Committee Secretary 

Shri N P Vankar, their treasurer, Shri P 

C Mistree and Activists Shri M S 

Panchal & Shri Satish Mahajan. 

 

ALIGARH 
On 06-05-2025 Office bearers of our 

Aligarh Region, Sri Vidhu Mohan, JGS 

and Sri Kanchhi Lal, RS, visited RO, 

Aligarh and greeted Mr. Ajit Kumar 

Jagga on his promotion to DGM and 

retention in RO Aligarh. He was elated 

on this gesture of CBROA and reiterated 

his promise to support to the seniors. 

 

BENGALURU 

In continuation with the Welfare 

Activities of our organisation, on 9th of 

May, CBROA, Team Bengaluru led by 

our activist Sri P M Shanbhag, visited 

the residences of 3 members who 

couldn't attend the felicitation at our 

office due to their health conditions and 

honoured them in the presence of their 

family members. They are (Staff No in 

brackets): Sri Ramesh Bhat B (7124), 

Sri Dinesh Tarakanath Nayak (4988) & 

Sri K Gurudas Rao (5931). Here's the 

link to photos taken on the occasion. 

On this memorable occasion and 

applauding our efforts Sri Dinesh 

Tarakanath Nayak and Sri K Gurudas 

Rao donated Rs 10,000/- each towards 

the Welfare Fund of our Organisation. 

CBROA Team Bengaluru, sincerely 

thank the 3 stalwarts for wholeheartedly 

and with open arms, welcoming us to 

residences to do the honours. 

In continuation with our programme of 

felicitating members at their residences, 

on 13th May, Team Bengaluru visited the 

Residences of two of our members. 

They are: 1. Sri M L Padanthaya (Staff 

No. 6441, LM 5471) & Sri Y N Lakshmi 

Prasad (Staff No. 11936, LM 3097). Sri 

Padanthaya is affected with paralytic 

stroke and Sri Prasad has fractured 

ankle and for both of them climbing 

stairs is impractical. The members, as 

well as their family members and friends 

were happy to receive us and to get 

honoured.  CBROA sincerely thank both 

of them, their family members and 

friends. On this momentous occasion Sri 

Lakshmi Prasad donated Rs 5,000/- for 
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the Welfare Fund Corpus as his token of 

love and affection to CBROA. 

On 16th of May CBROA Team 

Bengaluru felicitated Sri P R Subba Rao 

(5846) at our Central Office, Bengaluru. 

Though he was slated to be honoured 

on 22nd May along with other 15 

Honourees, we had to prepone his 

felicitation as Sri Rao was leaving to 

USA on 21st of May. Sri Rao was very 

much pleased with this gesture of 

Bengaluru Team. 

It is the tradition of CBROA to felicitate 

its members who have crossed the age 

of 75 and 90 years as per one of its 

Welfare Schemes. On the evening of 

22nd May, our Activist Sri P M Shanbhag 

initiated and organised one such 

function, where 15 Members were 

honoured. They are (Staff No in bracket 

& photos in seriatim): 1. Sri. P Rajagopal 

(1833), 2. Sri. Parasuram Ramaswamy 

(8604), 3. Ms Lalitha Bhaskar (9533), 4. 

Sri. T P Muthanna (21359), 5. Sri. B K 

Gurumurthy (10076), 6. Sri. H S 

Prabhakar (8707), 7. Sri. G K Bhat 

(11941), 8. Sri. V Arunachalam (9621), 

9. Sri.   K V Sugavanam (10033), 10. 

Sri. C V Nagaraj (10139), 11. Sri. K P 

Mahabaleshwar (9260), 12. Sri. K R 

Karantha (10437), 13. Sri. K S 

Nagabhushana Rao (10747), 14. Sri. L 

K Venugopal (7454), 15. Sri. G 

Ananthayya Hande, Chairman, CBROA 

(12439). CBROA Team Bengaluru, 

profusely thank each one of the 

members who participated in the 

felicitation function and made it a grand 

success 

On the occasion we have received 

donation from the following members 

towards CBROA Welfare Fund: 1. Sri K 

R Karantha - Rs. 5000, 2. Sri V 

Arunachalam - Rs. 5000, 

CBROA Thank all the donors for their 

contribution in building up corpus for our 

Welfare Measures. 

 

CHENNAI 
CBROA Chennai Region, honoured the 

following senior members who have 

attained the age of 75 years at their 

residence and handed over the citation 

and gift on behalf of CBROA: 1) Sri N. 

Sethupathy (12755), 2) Sri V G Prakash 

(19512) & 3) Sri K Sundaram. 

On behalf of all the members and on 

behalf of CBROA, Team Chennai 

wished them long live and happy and 

healthy life. Team Chennai also 

appreciate the efforts of Mr 

Krishnakumar, Regional Secretary, Mrs 

Sumathi Iyer, AGS and Activist Mr 

Srinivasan in meeting our seniors and 

honour them at their residence.  

CBROA will salute all the three seniors 

of 75 years  as well as other three 

stalwarts who are instrumental in 

meeting and honouring them and also 

obtained Associate membership from 

them. 

 

DELHI 
On 13th May 2025, CBROA, Delhi 

Region felicitated Mr. Naresh Kumar 

Sethi, on his attaining 75 years of age 

on 26th March 2025. He Superannuated 

from service on 31st Mar 2010. He has 

worked at different branches including 

inspection. Mr. Sethi staff no is 53115 

and membership no. 3093. Mr. Sethi  

was felicitated by Central office bearers 

of CBROA , Mr. Venkat Ramani, VP, Mr. 

Mukesh Kapoor, DGS and Activist Mr.S 
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K Wadhawan. Mr. Sethi's Daughter, Son 

in law and granddaughter were also 

present on the occasion. We wish Mrs & 

Mr Sethi a very long, happy & healthy 

life. Mr. Sethi thanked CBROA for the 

felicitation and shared his memories and 

experience. 

 

MADHYA PRADESH – INDORE 
Happy to inform that on 3rd May 2025 

our CBROA Indore team has felicitated 

Sri Nawal Kishore Singhal (15749) on 

his 75 th birthday. Our dynamic and 

energetic members and activists led by 

RS Sri Vasudev Patidar visited at the 

residence of Sri N K Singhal and 

felicitated him with bouquets, Shawl, 

Sreefal and also given him the certificate 

sent by Central office CBROA. Excellent 

job done by our Indore team and they all 

deserve appreciation, 

 

MUMBAI 
Regional Committee Meeting of our 

Mumbai Region was held on 2nd May 

2025, at CBOA Office at Himalaya 

House (Courtesy CBOA Mumbai Office 

Bearers). Following R C members 

attended the meeting: 1) Mr 

Chandrakant Salian, 2) Mr Prakash 

Mangle, 3) Mrs Vidya Shanbhag, 4) Mr 

Sanjay Sant, 5) Mr Sunil Achrekar, 6) Mr 

R A Shahpurkar, 7) Mrs Kalpana 

Deokule, 8) Smt Meena Sawant, 9) Mr 

Ganesh Saindre. 

Following Central Office Bearers were 

present at the meeting and guided the 

proceedings:1) Mr R M Joshi, VP 2) Mrs 

Pratibha Jayaram, DGS, 3) Mr A M 

Pandhre, AGS 4) Mr Ravindra Kamat, 

CC Member 5) Mr Pradeep Satam, RS 

6) Mr Sudheer Kulkarni, RS 7) Mr 

Manmohan Singh Sehgal, RS 8) Mr 

Milind Shringarpure, RS & 9) Mr Suresh 

Kokal, RS.  

Mr R M Joshi welcomed all the 

participants who had come in spite hot 

Sun & humidity in the climate. He, then 

requested Mr Milind Shringarpure to 

appraise RC members about what has 

transpired in the CC meeting held on 9th 

April 2025 at Hubballi. Mr Shringarpure 

briefed them accordingly. He informed R 

C members that our General Secretary 

was very particular about Associate 

Membership & it was pointed out by him 

that except 5 or 6 Regions, performance 

of the Regions in securing Associate 

Membership is not satisfactory. It was 

pointed out in the CC that there is 

tremendous scope in securing Associate 

Membership of family Pensioners. Mr 

Shringarpure informed RC members 

that Mr P R Bhalerao has given 

commitment in the CC meeting that 

Mumbai Region will ensure good 

number of Associate Members in the 

days to come. He informed RC 

members that Mumbai Region has 

secured three trophies for Associate 

Membership, for donations, & for life 

membership.  RC members were happy 

about the same. 

After appraising RC members about CC 

meeting by Mr Shringarpure, Mr R M 

Joshi informed RC members that 

Mumbai Region has secured Associate 

Membership of only 20% of our Primary 

Members. He appealed to RC members 

that daily they should contact at least 4 

to 5 Primary Members, find out whether 

their spouses are our Associate 

Members & if not try to secure their 

Associate Membership.  It was also 

informed to RC members that we should 

try to put in very serious efforts to 

secure membership of e-Syndicate 
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Retirees. It was felt that we should bring 

in one or two e-Syndicate members to 

Regional Committee.  

RC members were advised to be alert 

when any of our member expires. We 

should extend all the help to surviving 

spouses to ensure smooth 

commencement of their family pension.  

RC members were also advised to help 

our members in submission of their 

health insurance claims when there is 

any hospitalisation. RC members were 

informed that Regional Chairman would 

be nominated shortly.  

RC members were also appraised by Mr 

Sudheer Kulkarni about ensuing 

felicitations of our members who have 

attained / will be attaining 75/90 years of 

age by June end & citations received 

from Central Office were distributed 

among C C members as per areas of 

their residences. It was decided to do 

the respective felicitations as per 

attainment of 75/90 years by the 

respective members, subject to 

convenience by subject members. Mr R 

M Joshi informed CC members that he 

will arrange to deliver required sets of 

mementos & shawls to CC members 

shortly.  The meeting concluded with a 

vote of thanks by Mr Sanjay Sant.  

On 11th May 2025, CBROA, Mumbai 

Region felicitated Mr S N Bendigiri on 

his attaining 75 years of age on 1st April 

2025. He is born on 1st April 1950. He 

joined the Bank on 21st January 1972 & 

retired on superannuation on 31st Mar 

2010.  

He used to conduct mock interviews 

sessions for aspirants of scale I 

promotions, under the auspices of 

CBOA in a most exemplary way. Mr 

Bendigiri was felicitated by Central office 

bearers of CBROA, Mr R M Joshi, Mr 

Avinash M Pandhre & Mr Manmohan 

Singh Sehgal, as well as by his friends 

like  Mr Ramakant Barhale, Mr S G 

Polekar, & Mr Waman Ghope . Our 

Regional Committee members Mr 

Prakash Mangale & Mr C P Salian were 

also present. Mr Raghvendra , son of Mr 

Bendigiri was also present on the 

occasion. We wish Mrs & Mr Bendigiri a 

very long, happy & healthy life.  

On 12th May 2025, our Mumbai Office 

Bearers felicitated Mr N G K Shenoy, at 

his residence at Kandivli East, on his 

attaining 90 years of age on 10th May 

2025. He is born on 10th May 1935. He 

joined the Bank on 23rd Aug 1955 & 

retired on superannuation on 31st May 

1995. Friends, even at this age, he has 

razor sharp memory, mentioning names 

of many people to whom he had worked 

with. On the occasion, he has donated 

Rs 9000/- to CBROA, for which we 

extend our sincere thanks to him. Mr 

Ashok Katke, our activist, was also 

present for his felicitation.   

We wish him & Mrs Shenoy a long, 

healthy & peaceful life.  

Team Mumbai, on 14th May 2025, 

felicitated Mr Bharat Dhada, on his 

attainment of 75yrs of age. Born on 17th 

Jan 1950, Mr Bharat Dhada joined the 

Bank on 20th November 1972 & retired 

on superannuation on 31st Jan 2010. 

Mrs Arati Dhada is already our 

Associate Member. On the occasion, Mr 

Vivek Kinikar was also present.  

We wish Mrs & Mr Bharat Dhada long, 

healthy & happy life. Mr Dhada gave a 

donation of Rs 5000/- to CBROA, for 

which we extend our sincere thanks to 

him.  

It was festival offelicitations at our 

Mumbai Region.  Starting from 11th of 

May felicitation programme is 
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continuously being taken up by our 

office bearers. On the evening of 

17/05/2025, CBROA Mumbai unit 

felicitated Mr.T.B.Shanbhag at his 

Thane residence on attaining 90 years 

of age. Born on 24/02/1935 

Mr.Shanbhag joined the services of the 

Bank on 15/09/1953 at Foreign 

Department Mumbai. After serving at 

various places and capacities, he retired 

as Deputy General Manager on 

28/02/1995 from H.O.Bangalore.  

Following CBROA members participated 

in the felicitation 

1) Mrs.Pratibha Jayaram, 2) Mrs Savitri 

Natarajan, 3) Mrs Anuradha Phadke, 4) 

Mr.Jayant Kelkar, 5) Mr.Subhash 

Panhale & 6) Mr.Sudheer Kulkarni.  

On this occasion Mrs Vathsala 

Shanbhag joined CBROA as Associate 

Member. CBROA welcome Mrs 

Shanbhag and wishes Mr and Mrs 

Shanbhag a long, healthy and peaceful 

life. 

 

On 18th May 2025, Sri R M Joshi, Mr A 

M Pandhre , Mr Milind Shringarpure, Mr 

Pradeep Satam & our activist, Mr Vilas 

Kudalkar felicitated Mr Dilip Sawant on 

attaining 75 years of age on 9th May 

2025. Born on 9th May 1950, he joined 

the Bank on 8th May 1972 & after 

serving in various branches / 

Administrative Offices retired on 31st 

July 2009. While in service, he was 

Office Bearer of CBOA & also Mumbai 

Circle Liaision for CBOA. Mr Dilip 

Sawant has today donated Rs 5000/- to 

CBROA.  Mrs Anuradha Sawant joined 

us today as Associate Member. While 

welcoming her to our fold, we wish both 

Mrs & Mr Sawant, Happy, Healthy & 

Long life.  

 

MYSURU 
CBROA, Mysore Region held a 

members meeting today in our Sri 

Devaraj URS house at Vidyaranya 

Puram, Mysuru.  Invocation was 

rendered by Sri Puttanna. One-minute 

silence was observed as a mark of 

respect to the departed souls of Sri 

Satish Chandra & Sri Shankara 

Narayan, who have passed away 

recently.  

Shri Shivaprasad extended a warm 

welcome to all members. He addressed 

the gathering covering the CC meeting 

deliberations held at Hubli and shown 

the prize secured in mobilising more LM 

And AM . He requested members to 

mobilise more Associate members and 

also Life membership. He also informed 

the latest position on Updation of 

pension referring to M C Singla case. 

Sri Vithoba delivered a talk on Kannada 

Sahitya and Yoga how it helps body and 

soul, he explained in detail about how 

we have to be after retirement.  Sri 

Alfred d Souza and Sri Harish explained 

about how to invest in stock market and 

the present scenario of market 

conditions. Also informed how we have 

to be careful in whatsapp links in 

connection with investment in stock 

market. Sri K Srinivasa explained about 

carefulness in investment in share 

market. 

Madam Lakshmi Vittal was so happy in 

attending today's meeting and urged the 

members to be active after retirement 

and shared how it helps in improving 

health of every individual. 

Sri Devaraja Urs informed the members 

to be more active after retirement by 

spending time with friends and meetings 

our colleagues very frequently which 

helps in health improvement. 
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Sri K A Jaiprakash was honoured on 

completing 75 years. Another 5 

members were not attended the function 

who were to be honoured today. It was 

decided to honour them at their houses. 

Shri M Jayaraju proposed vote of thanks 

and specially thanked Sri K A 

Jaiprakash and Sri Dinesh Chiplunkar 

who sponsored the lunch, Sri Devaraja 

Urs for making available the place and 

members in general for attending the 

meet 

 

NAGPUR 
Happy to inform that our Nagpur Unit 

Office bearers visited residence of Mr 

Sevakdas Ukey and celebrated his 75th 

birthday along with his family members 

on 25th May. We honoured both Mr Ukey 

& his wife with shawl, shrifal, bouquets, 

a gift and a sweet Box. A citation sent by 

our Bengaluru office was read and 

handed over to him. Our CC Member Sri 

Hemant Chandekar, Mr Laxman 

Sankade, Mr Pandit, Mr Khobragade, Mr 

Bhishikar spoke on the occasion. In 

reply Mr Ukey thanked CBROA Central 

Office and Nagpur region for the 

felicitation and donated Rs2000.00 to 

the CBROA welfare fund and also 

enrolled his wife as CBROA Associate 

member. We specially thanked Mr 

Ukeyji for the donation and welcomed 

Mrs Maya Ukey in to CBROA as 

Associate member. Mr Vasant 

Waghmare and our RS Mr Atote were 

also present on the occasion. 

Mr Sewakdas Chandrabhan Ukey joined 

Canara Bank on 26.11.1976 at 

Bhandara. He worked at various places 

before retiring on 31.10.2010 on 

superannuation.  CBROA expresses its 

sincere best wishes for entire family's 

happy, healthy, contended long life 

ahead. 

 

ODISHA 
75th Diamond jubilee birthday of our 

Senior Member Sri Duti Krishna Sethy 

Babu celebrated at Berhampur on 8th of 

May in a grand way. Sri Hemanta 

Panda, AGS, CBROA and Sri 

Rasananda Sahu from Bhubaneswar 

also graced the function along with 

family members of Sri D K Sethy. 

Citation from our Central office, shawl, 

flower buke was preseneted to him. Sri 

Hemanta Kumar Patra, RS, Berhampur 

read out the Citation, a shawl was 

handed over by Sri H K Panda, AGS, 

flower bouquet was handed over by Sri 

J Raghu Prasad Rao, a memento was 

presented by Sri D Bangaraya and Sri 

Rasananda Sahu, senior members. 

General members of Berhampur Unit 

meeting was also conducted and 

general matters discussed. 

 
On 21st May Office bearers of our 

Odisha Unit assembled at our Circle 

Office to greet the new General 

Manager in Sri Suman Chakraborty at 

CO Bhubaneswar. A very warm 

welcome was given by the new Circle 

Head to all the CBROA members. 

Present on the occasion are Sri 

Gyanendra Narayan Mishra, Sri Pratap 

Krishna Mohanty, Sri Bata Krishna 

Panigrahi, Sri Pravakar Nanda, Sri 

Rasananda Sahu and myself. The new 

General Manager has requested us for 

any discussion with regard to retirees 

matters anytime and assured all 

possible help. On behalf of CBROA 

Odisha Unit we have thanked our new 

General Manager and interacted with 

other circle dignitaries and HRM section. 
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PUNE 

   " बेला के फूल - साांगीतिक पांचमहाित्त्व " 

There was a lot of excitement over the 

Second Season of Bela Ke Phool that 

finally streamed on Friday, 2nd May at 

Swami Kripa Hall, Karve Road, Pune. 

As the title of the program resonated 

with the nostalgic memories down the 

lane from the days of Radio Ceylone, 

Binaca Geetmala, Chhaya Geet, Aapki 

Pasand and so on, the Musical Odyssey 

took us through the Five Element of 

Nature, Water, Earth, Fire, Sky & Air this 

year.  

No praise will be too high for our 

CBROA, Pune unit energetically led by 

Sriyuths R R Bagale, Deepak Dalvi & 

Sunil Mehendale. The program began 

with the felicitation of Sri Deepak Dalvi 

who has been promoted as a CC 

member. Sunil Mehendale & R R Bagale 

gave brief details of the recently held CC 

meeting and informed various 

developments cantered around the 

welfare of the Pensioner's pending 

matter. It's a matter of great pride our 

Pune unit is winning awards and 

accolades in several avenues at HO 

level. Kudos to CBROA, Pune unit. 

MC of the Programme Ms Jayshree 

Rajpathak initiated the topic of Five 

Elements of Nature in very absorbing 

story telling manner attracting instant 

attention of the audience with the 

Theme of the Evening. Tum Asha, 

Vishwas Hamare, Tum Dharati, Akash 

Hamare, Rama a group prayer set the 

tone followed by excellent renditions of 

“Phite Andharache Jale” by Sunil Dhuri 
& Priya Bhise and Pt. Bharat Vyas's 

memorable verse, “Ye Kaun Chitrkar 
Hai” by Hemant Chandekar. “Faza bhi 
hai javan javan” by Seema Yeolekar & 
“Thandi Hava” by Anjali Joshi was cool 

and clean like fresh air. Popular Marathi 

songs “Sharad Sundar” by Priya Bhise, 
“Malyachya Malyamadi” by Supriya 
Paranjape, “Rimjhim Pous Pade” by 
Jayashree Rajpathak took the audience 

on great nostalgia round of Yesteryears.  

“Naino Me Badra Chhaye” by Deepti 
Godbole, “Gaarava Varyavar” by Sunil 
Dhuri, “Khuda bhi Asaman se” by 
Bhaiyaa Saheb Godbole, “Tu Ganga Ki 
Mauj Me” by Pradeep Jain were 
professional rendition of highest order 

while Suhas Ballal with his “Chand Si 
Mehbooba” made a promising debut. 

We had a good number of Duet songs 

sung with verve and panche by all 

Singers. 

The evening began by paying homage 

to tourists killed in Pahalgam terror 

attack in Kashmir while it concluded by 

remembering Late Manoj Kumar. Sunil 

Dhuri & Pradeep Jain paid tribute to him 

by singing “Hey preet jahan ki reet sada” 
in the end.  

12 Singers, 24 songs, two months of 

planning & preparation, several 

rehearsals in studios, Special home 

practices arranged by Seema Yeolekar 

and Pradeep Jain in their respective 

residences, Great script preparation by 

Jayashree Rajpathak and Anil 

Deshpande were the memorable 

highlights of Bela Ke Phool -2025. 

Last but not the least, a professional 

sound system and arrangement by 

Hemant Uttekar and his team and 

excellent facilities and delicious Pav, 

Bhaji, Pulav by Desai Caterers were 

likeable, admirable.  

Special mention must be made of our 

MoC Jayashree for her tedious, 

tiresome job of steering a tough job, 

Thanks once again to all CBROA 
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members and families for their sizable 

presence and positive response. 

On 19 May 2025, Pune team felicitated 

our senior member Sri Jambekar 

Pradeep G (13287) at his residence in 

Pune. Sri Jmbekar had completed 75 

years (platinum jubilee years) on 

19.04.2024. Sri Jambekar along with his 

ex-banker spouse overwhelmed by this 

initiation of remembering and felicitating 

the member, he was happy to see the 

activities being conducted by CBROA 

and expressed his big thanks to 

CBROA. During his guidance to CBROA 

members he informed his way of 

maintaining health and happiness after 

SVRS 2001, Sri Jambekar is a VIOLIN 

artist since college time and after SVRS 

2001 he started performing VIOLIN as a 

professional artist today at this stage he 

is a wanting violin artist by many 

renowned stage performers, he had his 

shows at abroad and got recognized by 

Many Indian social organizations in USA 

and in India. A big showcase is filled 

with many awards and recognition.  He 

wished good health and lot of happiness 

to every member of CBROA and 

CBROA family members. Appellation 

towards CBROA he donated Rs 5,000/- 

towards CBROA welfare fund and 

played two beautiful songs on violin. 

 Sri R R Bagle, Sri Deepak Dalvi, Sri 

Suneel Mehendale and Sri Pradeep Jain 

were present for felicitation ceremony.  

 

UDUPI 
Monthly meeting was held on 16th May 

'25  at Syndicate Towers, Catholic 

Centre, Udupi. Sri Pradeepa R Bhakta, 

President presided over the meeting and 

other office bearers were on the dais.49 

members and associate members were 

present.  In the beginning house offered 

tributes to late Cholpady Damodar 

Kamath who expired on 24th April '25. 

Following   senior members were 

felicitated on attaining 75+ years. 

1). Sri U Jayaprakash Rao (LM 2970 

staff no 11452), 2). Sri B Mohan Prabhu 

(LM 3196 staff no 8991), 3). Sri S 

Ravindra Shenoy (LM 3850 staff no 

9794) & 4). Sri  B Manjunatha Shanbhag 

(LM 14344 staff no 187550) 

Sri Vishwanath Kamath, Sri H R Nayak, 

Sri Yogesh Bhat spoke about the 

honouries. 

Sri U J. Rao,Sri B M Prabhu recollected  

experiences of their banking service.   

All the honouries thanked associattion 

for remembering the senior members in 

the age of 75 and honouring them.  Sri 

S. R Shenoy and Sri B M Prabhu 

donated ₹5000/ each to CBROA welfare 
fund and Sri U J Rao contributed Rs  

10000/ to our region. House thanked 

these donors. 

Sri K M Nayak presented brief report of 

the activities of the unit and accounts for 

the year ending Mar 2025.House 

approved the same. President Sri 

Pradeepa Bhakta in his speech 

summarized the proceedings. He on 

behalf of CBROA wished the honouries 

and their family a happy, healthy & 

peaceful days ahead. 

Sri Maruthi Prabhu compered the 

program.  Sri Sudeendra Bhandary 

welcomed the gathering in the beginning 

and proposed vote of thanks. House 

thanked Smt Seetharam Tantry for 

sponsoring refreshments. 

 

 

TO ACCESS  PHOTOS, GO TO 

PHOTO GALLERY 



 

 

The House Magazine of Canara Bank Retired Officers’ Association  ®                                      P a g e  | 16 

 

 

 

POEM By: Arun Sunder Raj, Mem No. 4857 

Mobile No.: 8762013645 

 

 

 

AS LONG YOU OWN ME AS 

THINE 

 

Waving water in oceans vast, 

But not a drop to quench my thirst. 

Roses bloom with their beauty rare, 

Yet poking thorns are all I share. 

 

People dwell, in every place, 

No kin or kindred fill my space. 

Huge mansions rise, with grandeur high, 

No shelter from the world's dark sky. 

 

Laughter echoes and joy resounds, 

For me, only sorrows in line. 

Hotels shine, with luxury's gleam, 

But I cannot afford a dream. 

 

Oh, Unknown Creator, Divine, 

Let nothing be mine, still it's fine, 

As long You accept me, as Thine, 

As long as I belong to Thine. 

 

 

PROJECT PATIENCE 

 

For pregnancy, like the "gestation" time, 

For Projects "deadline" is the finish line. 

The delays test and grow irritation, 

As deadlines get closer, patience wears 

thin. 

 

In gestation time, large variations, 

Increases risk for mother and fetus. 

Likewise delay in project completion, 

Raise rift between builder and promoters. 

 

But like an young mother, surprised and 

proud, 

Forgetting all the pains, beholds her child, 

The end-users compromise to be 

pleased, 

With Projects successfully completed. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

MEMBERS PAGE 
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Book Review By Laxman Gorlakatte, Mem No 2902 
“THE GOLDEN YEARS; THE MANY JOYS OF LIVING A GOOD LONG LIFE.” 

Author: RUSKIN BOND 

Publisher: Harper Collins Publishers India, Pages: 154, Price: Rs. 399 

 

This book is by Ruskin Bond, one of India’s most popular writers. Born in 1934 Ruskin 
Bond grew up in Jamnagar, Shimla, New Delhi and Dehradun and a short stint in UK. 
He has authored novels, short stories, poetry, essays, anthologies and books for 
children. He received the Padmashri (1999) and Padma Bhushan (2014) and a Lifetime 
Achievement Award by Delhi Government in 2012. 
As a prelude to the book he writes “This book is about growing old and liking it. It may 
be helpful to those entering their sixties, seventies and eighties. It might even be of 
interest to young people who don’t believe they will ever grow old. They will, if they are 
lucky. So prepare for what is truly the best time of your life”. Interestingly the book is 
divided into 60 essays. Sixty is when one is bestowed with the title ‘Senior Citizen'. 
Through these absorbing essays, Ruskin Bond shares many joys, which make up living 
a good life. As we grow old we are bound to be hampered by health issues. But one 
must continue with work, be it for a pleasure or profit. There are so many who do not 
allow the advance of age to deter them from their creative pursuits or for their 
willingness to work for the betterment of human race' points out the author. The human 
brain is at it’s most fertile in our later years, when there is lifetime of experience at our 
creative disposal. No surprise, he has authored this book when he was well over eighty 
years. He finds that there is so much beautiful and worthwhile in this world. Nature’s 
seasons; Sun rise and Sun set; night and day; sunshine and rain; the earth’s green 
cover; the wealth of our forests, rivers and oceans to name a few. And human kindness, 
fortitude, the creative spirit, all of which come free, but are priceless. He calls upon us to 
look at everything as if one is seeing them for the last time. This thought will make one 
appreciate them all the more. 
He loves Reading, Writing, walking, watching Nature and enjoying his breakfast. What 
keeps him away from worries is his ‘laugh it away’ approach to criticism and troubles of 
life. His love for reading comes to the fore when he says that he is more a reader than a 
writer. Having started reading at a young age of ten, he has been reading one book a 
week, sometimes two or three. Reading has been always his niche pastime. 
He has some advice to writers. ‘If no one enjoys your writing, never mind, you have 
done it for yourself and your own pleasure'. He recalls that when he wrote his first novel 
“The Room on the Roof”, it was rejected by publishers. When he had lost all hopes, 
Aundre Deutsch a publisher chanced upon the manuscript and published it in 1954. The 
book bagged the prestigious John Llewellyn Rhys Award in 1957. From there on, there 
was no looking back in his long journey of writing, spanning over six decades with more 
than 170 publications. Perseverance paid off! 
Watching nature is a favourite pastime for the Author. The great wide beautiful world 
that is there for all of us to marvel at. And how? By using all the five senses we are 
bestowed with. Our eyes are windows to the world and all the wonders of creation. We 
hear too; the sounds of nature, the wind, rain and the ‘gossip' of birds. Great music and 
so much to hear from loved ones and enjoy! There is smell of mountain air, sea breeze 
or fragrance of flowers. We smell and enjoy good food too. The sense of taste! There is 
so much to taste; chocolates, chips and fish! With taste our taste buds keep going 
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making life worth living! And then there is the touch. The touch of a loving hand. He 
feels that one has to be more aware of the five senses. Why not appreciate all that the 
world has to offer through our senses! 
“I have been a great walker for the better part of my life” writes the Author. He loves to 
walk leisurely, not in a hurry. He would like to stop by on his way to enjoy the scenery or 
to talk to passers-by. A long walk will always take you somewhere-and you will discover 
others as well as yourself. “Wherever you are, try walking your blues away” and “Get 
out of the house. The song of bulbul is preferable to the squeak of the mouse” he urges. 
Reading and Walking have been his sure remedies to drive away loneliness. 
All sixty essays are short and crisp, which are just one or two minutes of reading. As 
one starts reading, the author appears to be in straight conversation with the reader. 
The simple and beautiful prose beholds the reader. Throughout, the author is warm, 
witty and whimsical putting life into words. 
An attempt at doing a chapathi which ended in a shape of India map, his savouring a 
bun by buttering and stuffing with mango chutney at odd hours of night to satisfy his 
hunger pangs and calling the two cut slices of bun as Laila -Majnu or Romeo- Juliet 
reveal his sense of humour. 
The book can be read in one go or one could dip into any part randomly and repeatedly 
without slightest feeling of repetition. 
Ruskin Bond sums up “These are our golden years. As we enter our seventies and 
eighties, we find ourselves arriving at a better appreciation of all that is worthwhile in our 
planet and in this world of our making” 
One is reminded of the lines, “Grow old along with me! the best is yet to be, the last of 
life, for which the first was made” by Robert Browning. Old or Young, this book inspires 
every one. 
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SET TO CROSS 

MILE STONE 
Attaining 75 years of age is a 

milestone in the life of a retiree. 

Though statistically, longevity of life 

has increased, we are coming across 

several instances where many souls 

depart from us even before reaching 

the above milestone. Under such 

circumstances, it is really a cause for   

greeting the retirees who are set to 

reach the milestone and enthuse 

them to tread along. With this 

objective and in response to desires 

of several members that CBROA 

News features a list of members who 

are crossing 75 years of age during 

JUNE 2025. 

 

MEM NOTITLE NAME STF NO CADREPLACE PIN MOBILE DOB

167 Shri NAGESH PRABHU  M 1275 OFF4 THANE WEST 400601 9920040731 03-06-1935

36 Shri RAJAMANI  M 3792 OFF3 CHENNAI 600017 99402 35781 15-06-1935

259 Shri RATNAKAR SHENOY  A 828 OFF3 MUMBAI 400067 7498615142 15-06-1935

2248 Shri MADHAV  SHENOY   T 1603 OFF3 BENGALURU 560010 080-23329587 22-06-1935

MEM NOTITLE NAME STF NO CADREPLACE PIN MOBILE DOB

1132 Shri A R  VISWANATHAN 15412 OFF1 CHENNAI 603202 9176996622 01-06-1950

1444 Shri MOHAN DURGAPPA METRI 13755 OFF2 TERGAON 581356 08284 321313 01-06-1950

2182 Shri SHETH SURESH BALAKRISHNA 13633 OFF4 PUNE 411038 9890064100 01-06-1950

3223 Shri KOLKAR AJINDRA GANGARAM 17762 OFF2 BELAGAVI 590001 9481327829 01-06-1950

3233 Shri VANAKI  B   B 27820 OFF1 BELAGAVI 590016 9972623702 01-06-1950

3304 Shri AMALENDU SHIKDER 24794 OFF1 BAGULA P.O 741502 9474791850 01-06-1950

3320 Shri NAYAK K S 12280 OFF2 BENGALURU 560059 9964036529 01-06-1950

3365 Shri SUDHAKARAN K P 25981 OFF2 KALPETTA P.O 673121 9447397527 01-06-1950

3376 Shri SHARMA  ASHOK KUMAR 11005 OFF3 FARIDABAD 121002 9818444748 01-06-1950

3414 Shri YALLAPPA ANANADAPPA LANDE 15095 DHARWAD 580001 9481462885 01-06-1950

3448 Shri SHIVAJI DNYANDEO DHENDE 15899 OFF1 DOMBIVILI EAST 421201 9987016690 01-06-1950

3710 Shri S M THOMBARE 14010 OFF3 MUMBAI 400066 9619529244 01-06-1950

4066 Shri USHA P  KINI 9892 BENGALURU 560098 9886475787 01-06-1950

4724 Shri MAHADOJI NEELAPPA KARNKOTI 21106 OFF1 KALABURAGI 585102 9901543192 01-06-1950

5312 Shri B NEELAPPA 18807 OFF1 KOPPAL 583231 9342827114 01-06-1950

5530 Shri SATISH KAPOOR 53228 OFF1 MUMBAI 400050 9892125091 01-06-1950

7305 Shri S SIDDA RAJU 33518 OFF2 KOLLEGAL 571440 9449777824 01-06-1950

7436 Shri ARJUN ZIPRU GUJARE 21051 OFF1 NASIK ROAD 422101 9422701640 01-06-1950

7987 Shri CHANDRASHEKAR UMESHAPPA MYALAD14630 OFF1 BETAGERI 582102 8217495517 01-06-1950

8538 Shri VISHNU G PATIL 14131 OFF4 PUNE 411038 9850741270 01-06-1950

10959 Shri E CHIRANJEEVI 21240 OFF1 TIRUTTANI 631209 9443286574 01-06-1950

NANOGENARIANS

SEPTUAGENARIANS
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SET TO CROSS 

MILE STONE 
 

Attaining 75 years of age is a milestone in 

the life of a retiree. Though statistically, 

longevity of life has increased, we are 

coming across several instances where 

many souls depart from us even before 

reaching the above milestone. Under such 

circumstances, it is really a cause for 

greeting the retirees who are set to reach 

the milestone and enthuse them to tread 

along. With this objective and in response 

to desires of several members that CBROA 

News features a list of members who are 

crossing 75 years of age during JUNE 2025. 

 

MEM NOTITLE NAME STF NO CADREPLACE PIN MOBILE DOB

12595 Shri N A HOSKATTE 166850 OFF2 DHARWAD 580008 9901927325 01-06-1950

12783 Shri UPENDRA KRISHNA  PRABHU 125008 OFF3 DHARWAD 580008 9448767651 01-06-1950

13242 Shri LAXMINARAYAN VENKATESH NAYAK 582970 OFF3 SIRSI 581402 9448679149 01-06-1950

13927 Shri LAXMAN SHANKAR NADUWIN MINI 12151 OFF3 BELGAUM 590010 9845313366 01-06-1950

3232 Shri KULKARNI  H K 9213 OFF2 BENGALURU 560076 9987444700 02-06-1950

3260 Shri GOPALA KRISHNA MURTHY  V 19426 OFF1 HYDERABAD 500035 9491881402 02-06-1950

14716 Shri E V VIJAYA KRISHNAN 12714 OFF3 PAYYANNUR 670307 7356802955 02-06-1950

3257 Shri DIVEKAR UDAY DATTATRAYA 13358 OFF1 MUMBAI 400092 9869120119 03-06-1950

5494 Shri SAMARES MAJUMDAR 17829 OFF1 KOLKATA 700035 9051899650 03-06-1950

7005 Shri LAXMAN RAIDAS 20566 OFF1 UDAIPUR 313001 9314180455 03-06-1950

3614 Shri MUTHUKRISHNAN  K 4289 OFF1 DINDIGUL 624003 9443722308 04-06-1935

7204 Shri M S SHENOY 10666 OFF2 BENGALURU 560085 9886720314 04-06-1950

3394 Shri NARASIMHAN  R 15442 OFF4 COIMBATORE 641038 9500885200 05-06-1950

6759 Shri VIJAY KUMAR RISHI 51863 OFF1 DEHRADUN 248001 6397913822 06-06-1950

7522 Shri ARUN KUMAR SINHA 16100 OFF1 PATNA 800023 9097089457 06-06-1950

3132 Shri MADHAVA MURTHY  P 9224 OFF3 BENGALURU 560085 9945198825 07-06-1950

3982 Shri PERNANKIL SRIPATHI BHAT 9216 OFF1 UDUPI 576102990177296e+11 07-06-1950

8396 Shri S V SATHYANARAYANA IYER 13518 OFF1 MYSURU 570009 9972796194 08-06-1950

14255 Shri VENKITARAMAN N S 9502 OFF3 PALAKKAD 678001 9447962260 08-06-1950

14932 Shri HAREENDRA PANICKAR S 201793 OFF3 BENGALURU 560066 9567136437 08-06-1950

14932 Shri HAREENDRA PANICKAR S 201793 OFF3 BENGALURU 560066 9567136437 08-06-1950

2642 Smt ROOPA  SASHITAL 9277 OFF2 MUMBAI 400007 9422660525 09-06-1950

3287 Shri SANTHANARAJ  M 11571 OFF1 TUTICORIN 628008 9442110972 09-06-1950

3273 Shri SIVASUBRAMANIYAN S 13616 OFF2 CHENNAI 600061 9444214570 10-06-1950

3495 Shri K ESWARA RAO 12575 OFF3 HYDERABAD 500035 9848810471 10-06-1950

4793 Shri P NAGABHUSHANARAO 11488 OFF2 VIJAYAWADA 520010 9989488683 10-06-1950

SEPTUAGENARIANS
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SET TO CROSS MILE 

STONE 
 

Attaining 75 years of age is a milestone in 

the life of a retiree. Though statistically, 

longevity of life has increased, we are 

coming across several instances where 

many souls depart from us even before 

reaching the above milestone. Under such 

circumstances, it is really a cause for 

greeting the retirees who are set to reach 

the milestone and enthuse them to tread 

along. With this objective and in response 

to desires of several members that CBROA 

News features a list of members who are 

crossing 75 years of age during JUNE 2025. 

 

MEM NOTITLE NAME STF NO CADREPLACE PIN MOBILE DOB

8167 Shri SURENDER SINGH SUKHEJA 54163 OFF1 DEHRADUN 248001 9634882913 10-06-1950

2194 Shri HARI BABU VERMA 13253 OFF2 DERA BASSI 140507 12-06-1950

5813 Shri P SRIDHAR 7782 OFF2 BENGALURU 562157 9880139365 12-06-1950

5924 Shri K S CHANDRASEKARAN 10609 OFF4 BENGALURU 560103 9886820891 12-06-1950

4625 Shri E  SELVARAJ 29090 OFF1 SENGALAKURICHI 627102 9994737689 13-06-1950

796 Shri MATHUR R K 17942 OFF1 GHAZIABAD 201005 9958129776 14-06-1950

10508 Shri RAMAN V 11851 OFF1 CHENNAI 600087 9444733369 14-06-1950

10768 Shri S N NAYAK 14811 OFF2 MYSURU 570020 9481513508 14-06-1950

3894 Shri SATHEESHCHANDRA M 10976 OFF2 MANGALURU 575004 9448202006 15-06-1950

4794 Shri K S BHAT 9314 OFF6 BENGALURU 560076 9731231377 15-06-1950

5393 Shri B MOHAMMAD ALI 12288 OFF3 MANGALURU 575001 9886737819 15-06-1950

5428 Shri M J RAO 7360 OFF4 HYDERABAD 500020 9052021666 15-06-1950

14112 Shri SURESH PRABHU H S86578 OFF3 UDUPI 576101 9886818840 15-06-1950

4159 Shri D  A  KINI 10482 OFF6 PONDA GOA 403401 9421313742 16-06-1950

7527 Shri BALACHANDRA CHOTHAR V 13735 OFF3 ERNAKULAM 682021 9496551640 16-06-1950

3053 Shri SALGOANKAR  DATTARAM  PRABHU 15603 OFF2 BARDEZ 403507 9923388999 18-06-1950

3439 Shri K NAGARAJA RAO 12592 OFF2 DAVANGERE 577004 8970063300 18-06-1950

3626 Shri AMALADOSS  A 14469 OFF2 DINDIGUL 624001 9944009359 18-06-1950

12874 Shri JAYACHANDRAN I V 14384 OFF2 KOZHIKODE 673006 8971449000 18-06-1950

1992 Shri M G VARADARAJAN 12729 OFF2 BENGALURU 560070 9448034812 19-06-1950

4751 Shri R  MANOHARAN 11348 OFF3 CHENNAI 600040 9884866545 19-06-1950

794 Shri HASMUKH RAI P SHETH 12672 OFF2 MUMBAI 400067 2228063662 20-06-1950

4251 Shri S  K  SHARMA 10116 OFF5 AGRA 282007 9760021740 20-06-1950

11847 Shri LANDGE KISHAN BALOJIRAO 13274 OFF1 PUNE 411027 9423206130 20-06-1950

1085 Shri RAMESH H 9168 OFF1 BENGALURU 560076 8971790685 21-06-1950

15130 Shri K PADMINI 129020 OFF1 UDUPI 576102 9108226344 22-06-1950

1415 Shri BONGALE SRINIVAS ANANTRAO 12149 OFF2 MUMBAI 400092 9967411789 25-06-1950

SEPTUAGENARIANS
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SET TO CROSS MILE 

STONE 
 

Attaining 75 years of age is a milestone in 

the life of a retiree. Though statistically, 

longevity of life has increased, we are 

coming across several instances where 

many souls depart from us even before 

reaching the above milestone. Under such 

circumstances, it is really a cause for 

greeting the retirees who are set to reach 

the milestone and enthuse them to tread 

along. With this objective and in response 

to desires of several members that CBROA 

News features a list of members who are 

crossing 75 years of age during JUNE 2025. 

 

MEM NOTITLE NAME STF NO CADREPLACE PIN MOBILE DOB

3236 Shri AMBROSE THAMBIRAJ  S 8268 OFF5 BENGALURU 560068 9353008612 25-06-1950

9333 Shri B M UMESH 14632 OFF1 BENGALURU 560109 9740952341 25-06-1950

9894 Shri H HARIDAS BHANDARKAR 11833 OFF4 MANGALURU 575003 9886831499 25-06-1950

4707 Shri S KALYANARAMAN 14309 OFF2 CHENNAI 600042 9445610774 26-06-1950

1127 Shri RAGHUNATHA RAO TAPSE 12789 OFF1 DAVANGERE 577004 9945595929 27-06-1950

3326 Shri GERSAPPA SATISH  A 8533 OFF2 BENGALURU 560068 9449013507 27-06-1950

3406 Shri SHANBHAG M L 9126 OFF3 MANGALURU 575004 9448442553 30-06-1950

7116 Shri P KRISHNA RAO 14785 OFF7 MANGALURU 575004 9901856565 30-06-1950

SEPTUAGENARIANS

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

The House Magazine of Canara Bank Retired Officers’ Association  ®                                      P a g e  | 23 

   

RETIREMENT DURING THE MONTH OF JUNE 2025 
EMPLID NAME GRADEDPCD BRANCH/OFFICE DOB MOBILE

48333 SUSHIL KUMAR SBS 18512 HATHRAS 20-06-1965 8171032450

56275 PRAVEEN KUMAR SHARMA OF1 1442 MIDHAKUR 05-06-1965 9319139089

57974 RAKENDU OF3 8309 MEERUT RO 30-06-1965 8433065900

58107 MRIDULA GUPTA CLK 18649 BULANDSHAHR 15-06-1965 8077356522

61094 ARSHAD JAVED SBS 1456 MUZAFFARNAGAR DEVI MKT MAIN 30-06-1965 9319413512

74276 JEEWAN CHAND CLK 192 AGRA M G ROAD 01-07-1965 9012123230

509837 SARESH SBS 18848 MEERUT BAGHPAT RD 01-07-1965 7505185967

55633 F A MEHTA CLK 4832 JAMNAGAR SME 16-06-1965 7600025400

44378 NAGARAJAN B K CLK 10415 BLORE N R COLONY 24-06-1965 9741017565

55974 CHANDRAKALA O OF1 10415 BLORE N R COLONY 29-06-1965 9379333836

56786 JEYASEELI THAYAMMAL G CLK 10437 ANEKAL 11-06-1965 9486865960

61428 MANJUNATHA B CLK 538 MYSURU CHAMARAJA MOHALLA 12-06-1965 9482988489

61629 SHIVARAJA A CLK 5580 HOSKOTE SME 20-06-1965 9880817137

61713 MURALI  V CLK 10695 AMARA JYOTHI NAGAR 22-06-1965 9481628328

65675 NARAYANAPPA CLK 2698 B'LURU RNR II BLOCK 02-06-1965 9448684191

66922 CHALUVAIAH SBS 2433 B'LURU BTM LAYOUT 20-06-1965 9743840199

68740 SHARADAMMA SBS 426 BIDADI 01-07-1965 9886984287

71640 NARAYANA RAO A CLK 8087 B'LURU HO CC 20-06-1965 7760997946

73280 SHIVANNA T CLK 788 B'LURU MADHAVANAGAR 12-06-1965 9449496092

73594 PADMAVATHI N SBS 471 B'LURU JAYANAGAR 4 T BLOCK 17-06-1965 9902524547

457350 GOWRI N MURTHY OF2 55134 CHICKBALLAPUR LBO 01-07-1965 9972177657

480046 JAYALAKSHMI N OF3 1812 B'LURU YELAHANKA SATELLITE 20-06-1965 9449268282

512884 K KALAIVANI SBS 681 B'LURU SHANTINAGAR 05-06-1965 9741465065

529510 LAKSHMAMMA K SBS 10673 RAMOHALLI 27-06-1965 9035721668

71187 DURGA PRASAD PATEL CLK 12809 BHOPAL CC 20-06-1965 9425625210

457512 DAYARAM THAKUR OF1 17760 BAGADI 09-06-1965 9826079148

479789 HUKAMCHAND JATWA CLK 296 UJJAIN 01-07-1965 9691741939

502762 HEERALAL RAIKWAR SBS 12809 BHOPAL CC 01-07-1965 7587908776

556413 KISHORE KUMAR MESHRAM SBS 17711 KHAIRLANJI 18-06-1965 9424979701

55668 ARUN KUMAR TRIPATHY CLK 18001 BHUBANESHWAR KALPANA SQUARE 01-07-1965 9438133445

55878 RAJAT KUMAR NANDA OF1 1733 GIDIGHATTY 22-06-1965 9438398688

62797 D K SINHA CLK 4919 CUTTACK NAYA BAZAR 09-06-1965 8280210162

88463 NETRANANDA KHUNTIA SBS 339 DHENKANAL 22-06-1965 9938887228

AGRA CIRCLE

AHMEDABAD CIRCLE

BENGALURU CIRCLE

BHOPAL CIRCLE

BHUBANESHWAR CIRCLE
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RETIREMENT DURING THE MONTH OF JUNE 2025 
EMPLID NAME GRADEDPCD BRANCH/OFFICE DOB MOBILE

59206 NARESH PAL SBS 2399 CHANDIGARH SECTOR 44-C 01-07-1965 8054134861

62098 BALWINDER SINGH SBS 8099 LUDHIANIA B N CHOWK CC 28-06-1965 9569110205

65778 RAJINDER KUMAR OF2 2094 FEROZPUR 15-06-1965 8054687781

65839 AJIT SINGH SBS 2091 BUNDALA 15-06-1965 9876530250

75730 BHAG SINGH SBS 18121 FATEHGARH SAHIB 07-06-1965 9914622654

52623 K R SUNDAR CLK 1223 TRICHY CANT 22-06-1965 8220799467

57068 S INDIRA OF1 5227 THAVALAKUPPAM 15-06-1965 9486399119

58464 K K MANICKAM OF3 6955 NAMAKKAL  RO 24-06-1965 9940950959

59187 S ELUMALAI CLK 8088 CHENNAI-II CC 10-06-1965 9840840575

61490 RAVIKUMAR P S OF3 1217 SALEM FORT MAIN 29-06-1965 8056324791

62740 L SOMASUNDARAM OF1 2915 CHENNAI MOGAPPAIR 24-06-1965 9442472386

62910 SUDHA PRIYA DARSHIKA M OF4 763 THATHANUR 30-06-1965 9488478040

67252 M MURUGAN SBS 1198 VALASAIYUR 07-06-1965 8973732673

68881 M RAMALINGAM CLK 1670 KARAIKADU 07-06-1965 9443075954

73840 ANDIYAPPAN P SBS 8103 NAMAKKAL CC 20-06-1965 9786761965

75085 B ANDRUS ARPUDARAJ CLK 3082 CHENNAI PUDUR, AMBATTUR 10-06-1965 9444973283

77003 K SUBRAMANI CLK 1338 NASIANUR 06-06-1965 8072151996

425061 K KUBERA SUNDARAM OF3 8301 SALEM RO 30-06-1965 6380618997

457729 PAULINE MILTON OF1 2539 CHENNAI VELACHERY 06-06-1965 9884661720

52214 ARTI MARWAH CLK 18515 DEHRADUN 16-06-1965 9219783322

55414 HIMANSHU PANWAR OF2 8118 RUDRAPUR CURRENCY CHEST 02-06-1965 9149011172

59406 MANJU SRIVASTAVA CLK 2817 NOIDA SECTOR - 6 01-07-1965 9818048548

59914 NAGAPPA HANUMANDAPA GADI SBS 390 DELHI NEHRU PLACE 05-06-1965 7683069579

67697 ARUN KUMAR OF6 7400 DELHI CO 11-06-1965 7317714911

72531 ASHAD SINGH SBS 2590 DELHI ROHINI SECTOR 5 25-06-1965 9868799938

75294 DARSHAN KUMAR DABAS CLK 5868 DELHI ROHINI SECTOR 24 01-07-1965 9711740571

75712 DEVENDER SINGH SBS 2817 NOIDA SECTOR - 6 01-07-1965 9999721920

452229 AMAR SINGH SBS 19086 DELHI D T C SUKHDEV VIHAR 03-06-1965 7503844031

463841 SUDHIR KUMAR RASTOGI CLK 19346 GHAZIABAD RAJENDRA NAGAR 01-07-1965 9868939680

465667 VIJAY KUMAR CLK 19019 DELHI NANGALRAYA 05-06-1965 9818923890

513018 MAYA DEVI SBS 2191 MODINAGAR 25-06-1965 8534943184

519605 CHANDRAWATI SBS 19109 DELHI DWARKA 01-07-1965 9015181368

676999 OMPRAKASH SINGH SHEORAN CLK 19100 DELHI NATIONAL PHYSICAL LAB 06-06-1965 9717291400

CHANDIGARH CIRCLE

CHENNAI CIRCLE

DELHI CIRCLE
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RETIREMENT DURING THE MONTH OF JUNE 2025 
EMPLID NAME GRADEDPCD BRANCH/OFFICE DOB MOBILE

64433 MURALI MOHAN K V OF1 7629 CCOE, BAGALURU 01-07-1965 9702208038

67755 SIDDARAMAIAH SBS 401 HO B'LURU 05-06-1965 8553713569

74334 BALWANT MOHITE SBS 401 HO B'LURU 15-06-1965 9448748352

504197 P SANJIVA POOJARY SBS 10096 C I B M MANIPAL 15-06-1965 9844885187

64149 SUDHIR G KANERKAR CLK 10557 NIPANI G I BAGEWADI COLLEGE 01-07-1965 9902250016

442716 ANITA MAHESHCHANDRA KAMATH OF1 595 HUBBALLI TRAFFIC ISLAND MAIN 19-06-1965 9900218481

559131 PEDDANNA H SBS 10609 TUNGABHADRA DAM 07-06-1965 8722715541

587682 TULASAMMA SBS 11813 DEOSGUR 01-07-1965 8951497006

59742 D NARSAIH CLK 1626 HYDERABAD KUNDANBAGH 16-06-1965 9866103529

75143 P AMABALAGAN CLK 13432 SECUNDERABAD A S RAO NAGAR 05-06-1965 9959834972

414955 B GEETHA SBS 13000 HYDERABAD NIZAMSHAHI RD 28-06-1965 8790427976

478898 SRI M SUDARSHAN OF1 12841 NIZAMABAD CC 03-06-1965 9704049784

499624 P BHALLU OF3 8317 RANGAREDDY RO 09-06-1965 9441016039

510895 MALLAVARAPU PRAKASH KUMAR CLK 2620 SECUNDERABAD CANTT SB 03-06-1965 9849270507

513269 K PRAKASH KUMAR CLK 13407 MALCHALMA 08-06-1965 9989749715

514079 SRI MIRIYALA KRISHNA CLK 5488 HYDERABAD KARMANGHAT 15-06-1965 9849844768

514149 A P YASHODA SBS 13011 HYDERABAD SITARAMBAGH 10-06-1965 9000769807

74716 BHIM SINGH CLK 8039 JAIPUR CC 10-06-1965 9672770683

76085 SURENDRA SINGH RATHOR SBS 2793 JAIPUR  VAISHALINAGAR 01-07-1965 7568579551

542254 RAM BHAROS MALAV CLK 2331 KOTA 01-07-1965 9950097171

55600 VED PRAKASH CLK 1403 SIRSA CIRCULAR ROAD MAIN 02-06-1965 9466613331

56616 RENU BAKSHI CLK 5091 PANCHKULA SECTOR 4 11-06-1965 6280949827

61120 SHEELA RANI SBS 2039 FARIDABAD TIKONA PARK 15-06-1965 9654939741

61802 BALWANT RAI CLK 18252 DACHAR 05-06-1965 9813415744

462639 RAJESH VERMA CLK 7424 UCHANA 23-06-1965 9416366039

516459 SAROJ DEVI CLK 2847 FARIDABAD SECTOR 16 08-06-1965 9899587833

55017 CHAYAN SENAPATI  OF2 8005 KOLKATA CC 17-06-1965 9445059254

62803 ANATH DAS CLK 396 KOLKATA SEALDAH 03-06-1965 8420694502

66370 MADHUSUDAN MUKHARJEE CLK 1426 PURULIA 18-06-1965 9475662231

479594 MAHUA MANDI CLK 19516 KOLKATA SUNNY PARK 10-06-1965 8697881088

55938 PAPPAL SBS 849 AGALI 01-07-1965 9947881657

JAIPUR CIRCLE

HEAD OFFICE

HUBBALLI CIRCLE

HYDERABAD CIRCLE

KOLKATA CIRCLE

KOZHIKODE CIRCLE

KARNAL CIRCLE
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RETIREMENT DURING THE MONTH OF JUNE2025 
EMPLID NAME GRADEDPCD BRANCH/OFFICE DOB MOBILE

55416 LAXMINARAYAN SARAL OF4 18698 KANPUR SHARDA NAGAR UM 04-06-1965 9369330672

59827 ASHOK KUMAR OF1 2650 KANPUR SWAROOP NAGAR 30-06-1965 9411827863

59852 ASHOK KUMAR SACHAN CLK 18701 KANPUR BARRA 30-06-1965 9838354795

60787 ARCHANA SRIVASTAV OF1 8330 BAREILLY RO 01-07-1965 9456821535

61173 RAJESH KUMAR SINHA CLK 5297 LUCKNOW LDA COLONY 30-06-1965 9415547743

62865 MOTI LAL SBS 1195 KANPUR MALL ROAD MAIN 01-07-1965 7348422757

64051 SHEELA DEVI CLK 18595 NARAULI 26-06-1965 9759553651

64431 MAHESH KUMAR CLK 2900 BBA UNIVERSITY LUCKNOW 01-07-1965 8874712181

73796 NARENDRA SINGH BISHT CLK 5754 VRINDAVAN 20-06-1965 9450403950

440428 KHEMKARAN OF3 18820 AMROHA J P NAGAR L D O 04-06-1965 9411672348

543628 RANNO SBS 3210 LUCKNOW JANAKIPURAM 10-06-1965 9639664935

605607 JYOTI SAH CLK 2611 LUCKNOW INDIRA NAGAR 27-06-1965 9511157211

52624 V MUTHUMANICKAM CLK 1619 SOMANTHURAI 08-06-1965 9080023872

56787 CHITRA M CLK 1206 COIMBATORE GANDHIPURAM 18-06-1965 9486412115

56788 MAYA JAYARAJ CLK 3935 BELLEPALAYAM 20-06-1965 9842041404

58463 MANIMEGALAI S OF1 8012 MADURAI CC 10-06-1965 9442181906

62460 SHANMUGAM R OF1 8212 DINDIGUL - LBO 15-06-1965 9442271058

63569 KEDARNATH BAURI OF5 7800 MADURAI CO 14-06-1965 9560958768

66277 D MANIMARAN SBS 3732 PATTUKOTTAI 28-06-1965 7373699768

66954 THAVAMANI A CLK 16202 DINDIGUL NAGALNAGAR 15-06-1965 9047313190

72201 RAJENDRAN R SBS 1207 COIMBATORE RS PURAM 15-06-1965 9965123151

72749 MURUGANESAN M SBS 7429 TIRUPPUR GOVT HOSPITAL 18-06-1965 9626544734

80462 ANTONI AMMAL A SBS 1898 ALATHUR 09-06-1965 9952588331

469184 R DEVENDRAN OF4 8302 TIRUPPUR RO 15-06-1965 9944750079

44167 SALEEM AHAMED SBS 766 KAREHALLI 05-06-1965 7483235387

62577 MOHSINA BANU CLK 5389 INDAVARA 14-06-1965 9980257259

68677 LAXMINARAYANA GOWDA P CLK 615 PUTTUR 24-06-1965 9902433265

69999 DADAPEER M SBS 8024 DAVANGERE CC 12-06-1965 8660910557

70002 SHASHIDHARAPPA H S CLK 1590 DAVANGERE KB EXTN 16-06-1965 9448256576

481029 VASANTHI SBS 2928 MANGALURU KOTTARA CHOWKI 01-07-1965 9845198362

606266 SANJEEVA NAIK K SBS 10140 UPPINANGADY 16-06-1965 9480635827

LUCKNOW CIRCLE

MADURAI CIRCLE

MANGALURU CIRCLE
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RETIREMENT DURING THE MONTH OF JUNE 2025 
EMPLID NAME GRADEDPCD BRANCH/OFFICE DOB MOBILE

44164 SATHISH S HITTALMANI CLK 5333 BETAKERUR 25-06-1965 8880039584

62605 SUNANDA S P SBS 1516 KODUR (SHIVAMOGGA DIST.) 21-06-1965 9449285096

62606 JNANESHWAR THAKU NAIK SBS 672 NANDANGADDA 01-07-1965 9686243482

65497 G GANGADHAR PAI CLK 604 GANGULI 05-06-1965 9449028377

66046 NAGARAJA S CLK 1515 CHANDRAGUTTI 10-06-1965 6360102886

72767 SIDDARAJU  A  M CLK 1063 BHADRAVATHI CHANNAGIRI RD 20-06-1965 8762953719

486390 SHIVANANDA DEMATTY CLK 10189 HOODE 14-06-1965 8660397298

515432 SHARADA B POOJARY SBS 10313 YELLAPUR 11-06-1965 9449064516

578200 JAYANTHI S SHETTIGAR SBS 10112 BRAHMAVAR 17-06-1965 9741503476

56684 UMESH N DHAK  OF1 4641 PALGHAR 18-06-1965 8411999928

60768 JULIET S BHANGA CLK 3788 VATAR 25-06-1965 9158741222

502809 KANTHABAI A KAWDE SBS 15083 MUMBAI MATUNGA (W) CENT RLY 13-06-1965 9987150180

55244 OM PRAKASH RAM SBS 286 FATWAH 05-06-1965 7488233266

75322 DILIP KUMAR SBS 8101 HAJIPUR CC 20-06-1965 9162061349

604037 MITHILESH KUMAR SINGH SBS 2865 LAHERIA SARAI 06-06-1965 9771111494

57302 N S PAWAR CLK 8119 NASHIK CURRENCY CHEST 14-06-1965 9890227083

59151 V N SALAME  CLK 15274 NAGPUR MANISH NAGAR 03-06-1965 9822936752

61058 A S SAOSAKADE OF2 1083 AMRAVATHI 01-07-1965 7038623521

70497 Y K ADMANE SBS 3920 NAGPUR BHARAT NAGAR 01-07-1965 9623691572

71816 VITHAL VISHNU BARGE SBS 7032 KARAD CURRENCY CHEST 01-07-1965 8108630602

97828 ABDUL GAFFAR CLK 3334 PUNE AUNDH BANER ROAD 30-06-1965 9421790438

58794 RAJARAM OF4 50023 ZI DELHI (ADMIN) 01-07-1965 9455402651

602967 V K LEELAMMA SBS 6499 KURICHY 01-07-1965 7034765968

607261 GIRIJA S SBS 820 TRIVANDRUM CHALAI 01-07-1965 9656645919

47043 Y LAKSHMAIAH CLK 13739 R S RD NANDYAL 10-06-1965 9966690200

61255 S TIRUPALU OF1 1962 CUDDAPAH CHINNA CHOWK 24-06-1965 9440514343

466259 SRI M R HARI PRASAD CLK 13171 TIRUPATHI 05-06-1965 9247747328

476175 P BRAHMAIAH CLK 13640 ONGOLE 01-07-1965 8179839669

504957 V CHINA LAKSHMAIAH SBS 13678 VELIGANDLA 10-06-1965 9441960742

540726 PETLURU VENKATA RAMANAIAH CLK 13490 SYDAPURAM 06-06-1965 9491455699

609397 PARRE CHENNAIAH SBS 13661 SINGARAYAKONDA 01-07-1965 9177058600

649409 GOLLAPALLI SREENIVASULU SBS 7294 SPLD ARM BRANCH KADAPA 22-06-1965 9025865230

THIRUVANANTHAPURAM CIRCLE

TIRUPATI CIRCLE

MANIPAL CIRCLE

PUNE CIRCLE

MUMBAI CIRCLE

PATNA CIRCLE

INSPECTION WING
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RETIREMENT DURING THE MONTH OF JUNE 2025 
EMPLID NAME GRADEDPCD BRANCH/OFFICE DOB MOBILE

57405 V SANTHA KUMARI OF1 2457 RAJHAMUNDRY GANDHIPURAM 16-06-1965 9440211276

61794 S BANGARAMMA SBS 8052 VISAKHAPATNAM CC 30-06-1965 6309318614

63281 V VENKATA DURGA SBS 680 VIJAYAWADA GOVERNORPET 16-06-1965 8886956252

65595 K RAMU NAIDU CLK 13599 DUVVADA VISAKHAPATNAM 01-07-1965 9959695646

67500 SHAIK AMEERUDDIN CLK 8018 VIJAYAWADA CC 10-06-1965 9030656604

514013 B SRINIVAS RAO CLK 13276 GUNTUR BRINDAVAN GARDENS 17-06-1965 9885663536

529093 BANDARO VENKATA RATNAM SBS 13277 GUNTUR DISTRICT COURTS 01-07-1965 7993972321

VIJAYAWADA CIRCLE
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LIFE MEMBERS ENROLLED DURING THE MONTH OF MAY 2025 

MEM NONAME STF NO SCL DOB MOBILE PLACE

15194 G VASU 48417 OFF1 20-04-1965 9840540820 CHENNAI

15195 DHARAM SINGH 59300 OFF4 15-03-1965 9478685332 RUPNAGAR

15196 T N K DAMODHARAN 60291 OFF3 21-04-1965 9442408011 MADURAI

15197 SANJAY GHANSHYAM NAVALAKHE 442451 OFF4 04-07-1965 9869386493 NASHIK

15198 SETHURAMAN K 14144 OFF1 01-05-1952 9487424343 BENGALURU

15199 NIMMAGADDA SITARAMA SOMAYAJI 440956 OFF6 27-04-1965 9483305659 TADEPALLIGUDEM

15200 G SRINIVAS KUMAR 56007 OFF4 21-04-1965 9866682524 SECUNDERABAD

15201 MOHANRAM P 69973 OFF1 21-04-1965 9448666513 BENGALURU

15202 SHOBHA P POOJARY 52664 OFF1 04-03-1965 9619190207 MUMBAI

15203 RAKESH SRIVASTAVA  57368 OFF1 05-01-1965 9973986979 RANCHI

15204 SUBBA NAIK K 56481 OFF4 04-02-1965 8277406616 BENGALURU

15205 GOPALAKRISHNAN NAIR 33376 OFF6 01-06-1960 9447307999 GURUVAYUR

15206 M PRABHAKAR 414737 OFF1 06-07-1958 9440634244 NELLORE

15207 KANISETTY NAGESHWAR RAO 244682 OFF3 08-01-1954 9951480246 NELLORE

15208 D SUDHAKARA SARMA 347066 OFF2 15-04-1960 9491285890 NELLORE

15209 P VIJAYAKUMAR REDDY 390538 OFF2 14-08-1958 6281327220 NELLORE

15210 RAVINDRA KUMAR 60789 OFF3 05-01-1965 7060081047 MUZAFFARNAGAR

15211 G NEENA HARIDAS 73981 OFF2 05-01-1978 9900034023 BENGALURU

15212 JAHAN SINGH 16526 OFF1 24-06-1949 9634116711 GANDRASHEIKH

15213 E K PRAVEEN KUMAR 58677 OFF3 26-04-1965 9447614839 THRISSUR

15214 VINOD KUMAR 56451 OFF4 25-05-1965 9625933612 GHAZIABAD

15215 BEENA KRISHNAN 371056 OFF4 06-03-1959 9447811611 THIRUVANANTHAPURAM

15216 LATA P BANGALORE 64925 OFF1 06-01-1965 9945847090 PUNE

15217 P SRINIVASA RAO 65100 OFF4 15-07-1969 9494772129 AMADALAVALASA

15218 SEEMA NIKHIL KAMAT 60925 OFF2 25-08-1967 9820254990 MUMBAI

15219 M P NANDANA 66698 OFF4 05-04-1972 9480131452 SAGARA

15220 NACHIAPPAN L 59576 OFF3 25-05-1965 9080118210 ERODE

15221 LEENA PETER PINTO 446897 OFF6 22-05-1965 9869284789 MUMBAI

15222 ANURADHA R P 64104 OFF1 31-08-1969 9447423466 MANGALURU

15223 P N RAGHU 48928 OFF1 19-05-1965 9482276017 BENGALURU

15224 V NAGARAJA 58761 OFF4 05-07-1965 9902927346 BENGALURU

15225 ANIL KUMAR SAXENA 435219 OFF2 15-06-1958 9999386927 GHAZIABAD

15226 ARUNA 63722 OFF2 04-10-1965 9442930424 TIRUNELVELI

15227 K KARUNANIDHI  60007 OFF2 05-07-1965 7418161053 TIRUVANNAMALAI

15229 BHAVANI MANNAN 60408 OFF5 05-02-1965 9042072666 COIMBATORE

15230 SREELAKSHMI T H 461254 OFF3 30-05-1965 9446557036 UDUPI

15231 K INDIRA 436775 OFF4 24-05-1965 9447799695 KOLLAM

15232 SUNIL KUMAR KHANNA 57968 OFF2 26-05-1965 9013291899 DELHI  
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LIFE MEMBERS ENROLLED DURING THE MONTH OF MAY 2025 

MEM NONAME STF NO SCL DOB MOBILE PLACE

15233 LEENA MATHEW 480932 OFF2 30-05-1965 8281900733 THIRUVANANTHAPURAM

15234 N VIJAYA RANI 52622 OFF1 17-05-1965 8072448384 VELLORE

15235 D VENKATESAN 58106 OFF4 25-05-1965 9445658095 CHENNAI

15236 K NARAYANAN 57067 OFF1 06-01-1965 9841153380 CHENNAI

15237 P V RAGHU RAMA RAYALU 52404 OFF4 15-05-1965 9920594610 HYDERABAD

15238 V RAMARAO 48973 OFF2 02-01-1956 8019293257 VISAKHAPATNAM

15239 ANANTH RAO B PADUBIDRI 56115 OFF1 16-05-1965 9448003996 MANGALURU  
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CBROA has been assisting members though in small measure, as an expression of 

solidarity with the beleaguered members at the hour of their grief/crisis. The entire 

scheme is borne mostly out of generous Donations from the members. While the CBROA 

thanks the donors for and on behalf of all the beneficiaries, it seeks generous and 

regular donations in this endeavour to stand by the members at their time of need. 

CBROA appeals to members for regular donations on the occasion of birthday 

celebration of their dear ones, say – Self, Spouse, Children, and Grandchildren and 

derive satisfaction of donating for a cause.  

Medical Relief paid during the month of May 2025. 

CBROA MEDICAL RELIEF DISBURSEMENTS MAY 2025 

SL 

NO 

MEM 

NO 
NAME STF NO PLACE 

SELF/ 

SPOUSE 
AMOUNT 

1 5389 K V CHANDRASEKHARAN 10353 CHENNAI SELF 30000.00 

2 13915 B SUBRAHMANYA SAMAGA S94210 MANIPAL SELF 30000.00 

3 5165 NIRIMAL KUMAR BEHERA 26924 BHUBANESWAR SELF 30000.00 

4 8325 PANDHARI A S 11189 BENGALURU SELF 30000.00 

5 13188 S SRIDHARAN 40239 MADURAI SELF 30000.00 

6 3192 GOPALAKRISHNA BHAT 11941 BENGALURU SELF 30000.00 

7 6434 AMAR SINGH 34592 AGRA SELF 30000.00 

8 13699 HEMKIRAN KONDEJKAR 47949 PUNE SELF 30000.00 

9 2915 Ms SAROJINI JAYAPAUL 23787 CHENNAI SELF 30000.00 

10 11513 Ms C V MANJULA 45065 HYDERABAD SELF 30000.00 

11 6576 MANIVANNAN R 26174 CHENNAI SELF 30000.00 

12 6157 GOSALA SUBRAMANIAM 23429 KAKINADA SELF 30000.00 

14 10482 

Ms U R PAMILA 

CHANDRIKARANI 40638 PUDUCHERRY SPOUSE 10000.00 

15 8140 TAPASKUMAR PANDA 38932 BHUBANESWAR SELF 30000.00 

16 4219 RANJAN JOHRI 17410 GREATER NOIDA SELF 30000.00 

TOTAL FOR MAY 2025 430000.00 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

CBROA WELFARE SCHEMES 
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Dear friends, 

Many members are voluntarily opting out of CBROA welfare scheme (Medical 

reimbursement scheme) and sending mails, WhatsApp messages. We are finding it 

difficult to consolidate. Hence, we have devised a google form to enable us to 

consolidate it. Please use the below mentioned link, in case if you wish to opt out  of 

the welfare scheme. 

 

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfWqCEh_u4aKy_KNrm9s_Dw8hAOfERsD7JOsHQkvJHeqle8

Mw/viewform?usp=pp_url&entry.740508370=Yes  

 

Jagadeesh J S 

General Secretary 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfWqCEh_u4aKy_KNrm9s_Dw8hAOfERsD7JOsHQkvJHeqle8Mw/viewform?usp=pp_url&entry.740508370=Yes
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfWqCEh_u4aKy_KNrm9s_Dw8hAOfERsD7JOsHQkvJHeqle8Mw/viewform?usp=pp_url&entry.740508370=Yes
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DATE AMOUNT NAME OF THE MEMBER STF NO MEM NO RECEIPT PLACE 

02-05-2025 300.00 PRADEEP PRAKASH 35223 11406 56315 AMROHA 

02-05-2025 4000.00 P V SUNDARESHA 12163 4903 56316 BENGALURU 

02-05-2025 5000.00 K SRINIVASA 9446 3023 56317 MYSURU 

05-05-2025 2400.00 A V SREENIVASA 20291 5135 56318 BENGALURU 

06-05-2025 5000.00 D P PRABHU 1529 1674 56319 MUMBAI 

07-05-2025 5000.00 R V PARWANI 24929 5264 56320 MUMBAI 

08-05-2025 1000.00 P R L ACHAR S3980 13893 56347 HIRIYADKA 

09-05-2025 5000.00 KUMUD M WANKHEDE 23926 5912 56321 DOMBIVALI WEST 

09-05-2025 10000.00 DINESH TARAKANATH NAYAK 4988 5061 56322 BENGALURU 

13-05-2025 9000.00 N G K SHENOY 761 152 56348 MUMBAI 

14-05-2025 5000.00 BHARAT M DHADA 13555 3049 56323 MUMBAI 

14-05-2025 5000.00 Y N LAKSHMI PRASAD 11936 3097 56324 BENGALURU 

14-05-2025 10000.00 K GURUDAS RAO 5931 3103 56325 BENGALURU 

16-05-2025 10000.00 RANGANATH H V 25717 2129 56326 BENGALURU 

17-05-2025 5005.00 K RAGHUCHANDRA 7941 4717 56327 BENGALURU 

17-05-2025 5000.00 B MOHAN PRABHU 8991 3196 56328 BENGALURU 

17-05-2025 5000.00 S RAVINDRA SHENOY 9794 3850 56329 UDUPI 

18-05-2025 5000.00 T B SHANBHAG 571 1570 56330 MUMBAI 

19-05-2025 5000.00 D S SAWANT 12455 3309 56331 MUMBAI 

20-05-2025 1000.00 D CHINNASWAMY 28852 13681 56349 MYSURU 

20-05-2025 1000.00 SHARADAMBA GURUNATH 8942 AM 56350 MYSURU 

21-05-2025 5000.00 P G JAMBHEKAR 13287 2553 56332 PUNE 

23-05-2025 5000.00 R K KARANTHA 10437 2638 56333 BENGALURU 

23-05-2025 5001.00 V ARUNACHALAM 9691 3463 56334 BENGALURU 

23-05-2025 5000.00 M A PAI 8901 3918 56335 BENGALURU 

26-05-2025 2000.00 S C UKEY 20217 10708 56336 NAGPUR 

26-05-2025 6000.00 B RAMESH 13648 9605 56337 MUMBAI 

27-05-2025 7500.00 SATISH KAPOOR 53228 5530 56338 MUMBAI 

28-05-2025 150.00 VIDYA SATISH AM444 AM-444 56339 MANGALURU 

28-05-2025 2000.00 CHANDRESH V BHATT 43556 11851 56340 MUMBAI 

31-05-2025 5000.00 E SAMPATHKUMAR 8957 776 56341 COIMBATORE 

31-05-2025 5000.00 S R ANJARIA 3263 6323 56342 MUMBAI 

31-05-2025 300.00 PRADEEP PRAKASH 35223 11406 56343 AMROHA 

31-05-2025 5100.00 ANITA SINGHAL 54173 AM-2009 56344 DEHRADUN 

 

DONATION RECEIVED DURING THE 

MONTH – MAY 2025 
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CBROA MEMBERS’ CONTACT INFORMATION - UPDATE 

Dear Members, 

Please find the Link (Sign in removed) to update your latest address, email and mobile 

number.  Please use the same in case there is any change in your Contact information. 

 

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfwTFvPqmP2nuZMktMj3VhDyhU4-

JaO5gSL02H5MkifCYsYIg/viewform?usp=sf_link  

 

Jagadeesh J S 

General Secretary 

 

 

 

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfwTFvPqmP2nuZMktMj3VhDyhU4-JaO5gSL02H5MkifCYsYIg/viewform?usp=sf_link
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfwTFvPqmP2nuZMktMj3VhDyhU4-JaO5gSL02H5MkifCYsYIg/viewform?usp=sf_link
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AHMEDABAD REGION 

   
                     ALIGARH REGION                                                                              CHENNAI REGION 

   

   
CHENNAI REGION 

   
DELHI REGION 
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MADHYA PRADESH – INDORE 

   

   

   
MUMBAI REGION 

   
                      MUMBAI REGION                                                                                MYSURU REGION 
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NAGPUR REGION 

   

   
ODISHA REGION 

   

   
PUNE REGION 
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PUNE REGION 

  
UDUPI REGION 

 

BENGALURU FELICITATION FUNCTIONS 

 

Please click the link to go through the Photos.  If you are viewing 

on laptop or PC hold Ctrl Key and click on the link. 

 
On 09-05-2025            :     https://photos.app.goo.gl/VJULieoHpDB3dBwCA  

 

On 13-05-2025            :     https://photos.app.goo.gl/7xosU9WEDMVHuVot9  

 

On 16-05-2025            :     https://photos.app.goo.gl/hobfNvAUGnc59Z827   

 

On 22-05-2025            :     https://photos.app.goo.gl/mBsJALWp8suGr4ZG8  

 

 

 

 

 

https://photos.app.goo.gl/VJULieoHpDB3dBwCA
https://photos.app.goo.gl/7xosU9WEDMVHuVot9
https://photos.app.goo.gl/hobfNvAUGnc59Z827
https://photos.app.goo.gl/mBsJALWp8suGr4ZG8
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OBITUARY 

 

 

 

During the month of May 2025, following members left us for Heavenly 

Abode. CBROA deeply mourn the passing away of our committed members. 

CBROA dips its banner in memory of these members who stood by the 

Organisation and supported CBROA in its endeavour to bring relief to the 

elder bankers during their sunset years. CBROA pays reverential homage to 

the fallen comrades. May the departed soul attain sadgathi. 
SL NO NAME STF NO MEM NO D O DEATH PLACE 

1 NAGENDRA SINGH 28641 5134 02-05-2025 BENGALURU 

2 S N SHENOY 8813 1475 03-05-2025 HUBBALLI 

3 P K GOPA KUMAR 17869 3501 May 2025 BENGALURU 

4 Bh L N MURTHY 16257 5087 11-05-2025 HYDERABAD 

5 M D MEHTA 1440 324 22-05-2025 GUJARAT 

6 S B MARATHE 7871 3486 24-05-2025 MUMBAI 

7 HARIHAR SINGH 32884 8056 24-05-2025 BARIPADA 

8 GURUNATH HEGDE 40758 11810 24-05-2025 MANGALURU 

9 R SHANKAR NARAYAN 52816 12288 25-05-2025 MYSURU 

10 GEORGE ANDRADE 27490 SYN 14076 27-05-2025 UDUPI 

11 ASHOK SUBRAO ITEKARI 20663 3793 30-05-2025 BELAGAVI 

 


